PW11-3016 City of Florissant June 28, 2011
Sign Post and Blanks

COMPANY COMPANY COMPANY COMPANY COMPANY COMPANY COMPANY
American Sign Brackets Ziglin Signs, Inc. J & A Traffic MD Solutions Custom Products Corp. Vulcan Signs Rocal, Inc.
P.0. Box 890 540 Viossbrink Drive 790 W. 40 Hwy PMB 119 8225 Estates Pkwy P.0. Box 54091 P.0. Box 1850 8950 Egypt Pike
Green Forest, AR 72638 Washington, MO 63090 Blue Springs, MO 64015 Plain City, OH 43064 Jackson, MS 39288 Foley, AL 36536 Chillicothe, OH 45628
Item| Qty Description Unit |  Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit |  Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit |  Total
1| 300/ 10 ft length flanged channel type post No Bid $17.14 $5,142.00 $14.77 $4,431.00 No Bid $17.72 $5,316.00 $15.12 $4,536.00 No Bid
2| 300] 12t length flanged channel type post $20.58 $6,174.00 $17.52 $5,256.00 $21.27 $6,381.00 $18.14 $5,442.00
3 Octagon
150 24x24 $17.35 $2,602.50 $8.55 $1,282.50 $8.88 $1,332.00 $11.48 $1,722.00
150 30x30 No Bid $27.11 $4,066.50 No Bid No Bid $13.43 $2,014.50 $13.75 $2,062.50 $17.94 $2,691.00
150 36x36 $39.05 $5,857.50 $19.38 $2,907.00 $19.91 $2,986.50 $25.83 $3,874.50
4 Equilateral Triangle
50 30x30x30 No Bid $17.98 $899.00 No Bid No Bid $7.88 $394.00 $7.32 $366.00 $9.78 $489.00
50 36x36x36) $39.68 $1,984.00 $11.30 $565.00 $10.33 $516.50 $13.19 $659.50
5 Diamond or Square
150 24x24 $17.35 $2,602.50 $9.44 $1,416.00 $9.45 $1,417.50 $12.68 $1,902.00
150 30x30 No Bid $27.11 $4,066.50 No Bid No Bid $14.62 $2,193.00 $14.71 $2,206.50 $19.81 $2,971.50
150 36x36 $39.05 $5,857.50 $21.05 $3,157.50 $21.33 $3,199.50 $28.53 $4,279.50
6 Vertical Rectangle
150 12x12 $4.34 $651.00 $2.58 $387.00 $2.06 $309.00 $2.27 $340.50
150 12x18 $6.51 $976.50 $3.66 $549.00 $3.59 $538.50 $4.31 $646.50
150 12x36 $13.01 $1,951.50 $6.96 $1,044.00 $5.76 $864.00 $6.81 $1,021.50
150 18x24 No Bid $13.01 $1,951.50 No Bid No Bid $7.02 $1,053.00 $7.12 $1,068.00 $8.61 $1,291.50
150 24x30 $21.70 $3,255.00 $11.73 $1,759.50 $11.79 $1,768.50 $14.35 $2,152.50
150 30x36 $32.50 $4,881.00 $17.54 $2,631.00 $17.76 $2,664.00 $21.53 $3,229.50
150 12x6) $1.35 $202.50 $1.21 $181.50 $1.14 $171.00
7 Horizontal Rectangle
100 30x24 No Bid $21.70 $2,170.00 No Bid No Bid $11.73 $1,173.00 $11.79 $1,179.00 $14.35 $1,435.00
100 36x12 $13.01 $1,951.50 $7.02 $702.00 $7.25 $725.00 $8.61 $861.00
Aluminum Street Name Assemblies
8| 200|Extruded aluminum blades 6x24 $8.10 $1,620.00 $4.88 $976.00 $3.92 $784.00
9| 150|Extruded aluminum blades 6x30 No Bid $10.13 $1,951.50 No Bid $6.11 $916.50 $4.90 $735.00
10| 100|Extruded aluminum blades 6x36 $12.25 $1,225.00 No Bid $7.04 $704.00 $5.85 $585.00 No Bid
11| 200]Sign-to-sign brackets $4.70 $940.00 $3.88 $776.00 $2.95 $590.00 $3.10 $620.00 $4.05 $810.00
12| 200|Post-to-sign brackets $4.82 $964.00 $4.38 $876.00 $2.95 $590.00 $3.10 $620.00 $4.05 $810.00
13| 150{Channel post-to-sign bracket $4.82 $723.00 $3.36 $504.00 $2.95 $442.50 $3.10 $465.00 $3.89 $583.50
Delivery (Days ARO)
Posts n/a 10 2-3 n/a 65 3-14 nla
Aluminum Traffic Signs Blanks n/a 12 n/a n/a 30 30 45
Aluminum Street Name Assemblies| 20 10 n/a 7-14 30 3-14 nla
Discount 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%

Prepared by Jenny Morris (314) 839-7621




