PR11-3003 Various Paint for Parks March 25, 2011

COMPANY COMPANY
PPG Porter Paints Sherwin Williams
2391 Schuetz Road 1555 N. Hwy 67
Maryland Heights, MO 63146 Florissant, MO 63031
Item Description Unit Total Unit Total
1  |Yellow Traffic Paint (50 Gallons) 1 Gin $10.50 $525.00 no bid no bid

5 GIn $52.50 $525.00 $43.50 $435.00

Touch Guard hd poly coating - Osha Safety code

2 colors: white, black, red, blue, green, purple, yellow $16.92 $1,353.60 $18.75 $1,500.00
orange (80 Gallons)

Floor guard, alkyd gloss enamel std colors: white,

3 black, red, blue, yellow, purple, orange (50 Gallons) $20.02 $1,001.00 $18.75 $937.50
Exterior acrylic latex house paint - colors: white green,

4 $13.29 $996.75 $16.50 $1,237.50
red, blue, yellow, purple, orange (75 Gallons)
Polor ice paint, white, as mfg. by Reardon Co. or equal : : : :

5 in 25 Ib bags (500 Ibs) no bid no bid no bid no bid

6 Field marking paint (200 Gallons) $34.88/5gal [ $1,395.20 $7.50 $1,500.00

Cash Discount 0% 0%

Prepared by Jenny Morris (314) 839-7621



