PW12-3071 City of Florissant August 17, 2012
Improvements and Renovations to Tower Court Park
Company Company Company Company Company Company Company Company
Tramar Contracting, Inc. C. Rallo Cc::iractlng Co, Spencer Contracting The Harlan Company Concrete Design, Inc. Kay Bee Electric Fry & Associates, Inc. SChne'd:;rs;lTstrUCtlon
3051 Mercantile Ind. Drive 5000 Kemper Avenue 3073 Amold Tenbrook Road 9810 Page Bivd 11388 Dorsett Road 250 Rue Saint Francois 101 E. 15th Avenue 429 N. Main
Saint Charles, MO 63301 Saint Louis, MO 63139 Amold, MO 63010 Saint Louis, MO 63132 Maryland Heights, MO 63043 Florissant, MO 63031 North Kansas City, MO 64116 O'Fallon, MO 63366
Item| Qty Description (Electrical Work Only)
Prefabricated Restroom with concrete per Site Plan
#1 LS. Drawings & Specifications $202,000.00 $208,967.00 $212,179.00 $214,700.00 $219,226.00 $2,545.00 No Bid No Bid
Prefabricated Restroom with concrete at alternate
#2 LS. location No Bid $213,483.00 No Bid $248,600.00 No Bid $4,190.00 No Bid No Bid
Provide Design/ Build Restroom with concrete at $95,000.00 / Alt:
#3 LS. alternate location No Bid No Bid No Bid $88,700.00 No Bid $7,020.00 No Bid $105,000.00
Provide Design/ Build Site Electric, Sanitary and
H#4 LS. Water Supply at alternate location No Bid No Bid No Bid $70,100.00 No Bid $4,320.00 No Bid No Bid
#5 L.S. Avrtificial Turf Repairs| $10,500.00 $12,592.00 $14,431.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Replace tennis court fencing/ gates and paint fence
#6 L.S. posts $39,800.00 $41,571.00 $44,052.00 $37,900.00 $44,823.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
#7 LS. Prefabricated Shelter and concrete $21,500.00 $22,721.00 $16,923.00 $21,100.00 $21,577.00 No Bid $27,291.00 $20,000.00
#3 L.S. Replace Tennis Court Lighting $26,500.00 $33,684.00 $54,032.00 $28,700.00 $45,550.00 $42,110.00 No Bid No Bid
Security Lighting: Provide three (3) pole mounted
#9 LS. security lighting fixtures on 10" concrete base $8,300.00 $7,978.00 $18,000.00 $9,900.00 $12,353.00 $8,620.00 No Bid No Bid
#10 Federal Apprenticeship Policy 20% 100% 90% 100% 100% 98% N/A 95%
Discount 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%

Prepared by Jenny Morris (314) 839-7621




