
PR13-3110 City of Florissant
Grass Seed, Chemicals and Fertilizers

March 12, 2013

Item Unit Description

1 per lb Turf type Fescue 3 - Variety Blend $1.12/ lb - 50 lb bag $1.14/ lb  ($57.60/ bag) $1.20/ lb - /50 lb bag $1.50 / lb $1.15 / lb $1.45 ($72.50/50 lb bag) $1.23 / lb

1 bag 12-12-12 Fertilizer $14.75 /50 lb bag $13.00 /50 lb bag
2 bag

Fertilizer w/ crabgrass preventive (18-
23-4) $15.75 /50 lb bag $15.00 /50 lb bag

1 gal Embark-Growth Retardant

$142.00  /gal
Generic: $65.00 / 5#   ($390/cs)

2 bottle Manage $62.00 /1.3 oz
$20.00 / gal
$50.00 /2.59gal cont

$310.00 /2x2.5gal
$62.00 /gal

$22.50 /box of 20
$112.50 /cs of 100

Cash Discount

Delivery

Fertilizer (Liquid/Dry)

4 gal Speedzone

Barricade 65 WGcs1

Round Up Pro Max (1.67 gallon)gal3

COMPANY

Veatch Chemical
4357 California

Saint Louis, MO  63111

COMPANY

BWI
PO Box 512

Fenton, MO  63026

Grass Seed

Wednesday or Thursday

1 cs Talprid Mole Bait

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid $53.50
Growth Regulators

Insecticides/Misc.

Herbicides
No Bid $500.00 /50 lb cs

No Bid No Bid

No Bid $106.00 /2x1.67 gal - cs

$260.00

0%

3 Days ARO or sooner

COMPANY
Pawnee Buttes Seed, 

Inc.
PO Box 100 / 605 25th Street

Greeley, CO  80632

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

0%
5 Business Days after 

Receipt of PO

COMPANY

Pennington Seed, Inc.
PO Box 290

Madison, GA  30650

2% - 10 Days

10 Days After PO

0%
No Bid

No Bid

COMPANY

Univar USA
12111 Bridgeton Square Drive

Bridgeton, MO  63044

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No BidNo Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$330.00/6 - 5# (case)

COMPANY

 Agro-Logics, LLC
2330 Weldon Parkway

No Bid

No Bid

0%

3 Days ARO

No Bid

$61.30 / jug

$166.15 / cs of 5 box

$15.25
$18.00

$61.25

1% - 10 Days

On Request

No Bid

$195.00

$95.00

$40.00 /2x10 ct box

$265.00 / 4x5 lb

3 Days ARO

$95.00
$75.00 / bottle

$80.00

$250.00 / 100 worm case

COMPANY

Supreme Turf Products
5 Cassens Court

Fenton, MO  63026

COMPANY

John Deere Landscapes
1385 East 36th Street
Cleveland, OH  44114

$26.00
$26.00

$85.00

0%

$20.02
No Bid

$442.65

0%

5-7 Days ARO

$228.56
$78.18

$35.47

$81.36

$202.10 /5 x 2 tray box
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