
P14-3177 City of Florissant
Unleaded Gasoline

September 10, 2014

Item Description Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total

1
Unleaded Gasoline - Transport 

Delivery  (+/- 150,000 gallons)
extended totals not 
listed on bid sheet

extended totals not 
listed on bid sheet

OPIS Avg Price per Gallon - 
09/08/14 $2.7313 $409,695.00 $2.7313 $409,695.00 $2.7313 $409,695.00 $2.7313 $409,695.00 $2.7313 $409,695.00
Mark-Up -0.0100 -1500.00 0.0842 12630.00 -0.0089 -1335.00 0.0117 1755.00 -0.0200 -3000.00
Bid Price $2.7213 $408,195.00 $2.8155 $422,325.00 $2.7224 $408,360.00 $2.7430 $411,450.00 $2.7113 $406,695.00

2
Unleaded Gasoline - Tankwagon 

Delivery  (+/- 5,000 gallons)
totals on bid submittal 
extended at 50,000 

gallons
OPIS Avg Price per Gallon - 

09/08/14 $2.7313 $13,656.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.7313 $13,656.50 $2.7313 $13,656.50
Mark-Up 0.2000 1000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.1840 920.00 0.0800 400.00
Bid Price $2.9313 $14,656.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.9153 $14,576.50 $2.8113 $14,056.50

$3.0000 Other Applicable Surcharges: n/a n/a Dump Charge $50.00 n/a n/a Federal Lust $0.0010 n/a n/a
n/a n/a n/a n/a Fed Env Recovery $0.0017 n/a n/a
n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a MO Motor Fuel $0.0017 n/a n/a
n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a MO Insp Fee $0.0005 n/a n/a
n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a MO Load Fee $0.0025 n/a n/a
n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a Pump $45.00 (if applicable) n/a n/a
n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a Demarrage $80/ per 1/4 hr n/a n/a
n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a Short Load $40.00 n/a n/a

Discount
Delivery

0%
24 Hours ARO

COMPANY
The Kiesel Company

4801 Fyler Avenue
Saint Louis, MO  63116

24 Hours ARO

Energy Petroleum Company
COMPANY

2310 Kienlen Avenue
Saint Louis, MO  63121

0%

COMPANY
Petroleum Traders 

Corporation

0%

COMPANY
Mansfield Oil Company

COMPANY
RKA Petroleum Companies

28340 Wick Road
Romulus, MI  48174 Fort Wayne, IN  46804

7120 Pointe Inverness Way

* Subject to verification of taxes

Surcharge Included

1025 Airport Parkway
Gainesville, GA  30501-6813

1 Business Day
0%

1 Day ARO
.005 cpg / 15 Days

24 Hours ARO

Prepared by Jenny Morris


