
PW10-2947 City of Florissant
Sign Post and Blanks

March 30, 2010

Item Qty Description Unit Total Unit
Total Listed 
by Vendor

Actual 
Total * Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total

1 300 10 ft. length flanged channel type post $15.81 $4,741.50 $4,743.00 $16.14 $4,842.00 $27.37 $8,211.00 $14.30 $4,290.00 $11.79 $3,537.00 $19.00 $5,700.00 $14.92 $4,476.00 $14.06 $4,218.00 $12.54 $3,762.00
2 300 12 ft. length flanged channel type post $19.00 $5,698.50 $5,700.00 $19.36 $5,808.00 $32.84 $9,852.00 $17.16 $5,148.00 $14.15 $4,245.00 $22.00 $6,600.00 $17.89 $5,367.00 $11.84 $3,552.00 $15.06 $4,518.00
3 Octagon

150 24x24 $13.85 $2,077.13 $2,077.50 $8.32 $1,248.00 $9.24 $1,386.00 $7.38 $1,107.00 $8.43 $1,264.50 $7.74 $1,161.00 $7.00 $1,050.00 $12.49 $1,873.50 $6.81 $1,021.50 $8.29 $1,243.50
150 30x30 $20.95 $3,142.88 $3,142.50 $12.98 $1,947.00 $14.44 $2,166.00 $11.24 $1,686.00 $13.18 $1,977.00 $11.76 $1,764.00 $11.00 $1,650.00 $18.96 $2,844.00 $10.67 $1,600.50 $12.90 $1,935.00
150 36x36 $31.03 $4,654.50 $4,654.50 $18.74 $2,811.00 $20.79 $3,118.50 $16.45 $2,467.50 $18.98 $2,847.00 $16.98 $2,547.00 $16.00 $2,400.00 $28.32 $4,248.00 $15.33 $2,299.50 $18.34 $2,751.00

4 Equilateral Triangle
50 30x30x30 $9.57 $478.50 $478.50 $8.29 $414.50 $8.26 $413.00 $6.51 $325.50 $6.91 $345.50 $6.99 $349.50 $6.00 $300.00 $13.06 $653.00 $5.61 $280.50 $7.16 $358.00
50 36x36x36 $15.66 $783.00 $783.00 $11.74 $587.00 $11.01 $550.50 $8.98 $449.00 $9.95 $497.50 $10.05 $502.50 $10.00 $500.00 $18.78 $939.00 $9.06 $453.00 $10.18 $509.00

5 Diamond or Square
150 24x24 $13.99 $2,098.88 $2,098.50 $8.67 $1,300.50 $9.24 $1,386.00 $7.86 $1,179.00 $9.01 $1,351.50 $8.34 $1,251.00 $9.00 $1,350.00 $12.66 $1,899.00 $8.23 $1,234.50 $9.19 $1,378.50
150 30x30 $21.68 $3,251.63 $3,252.00 $13.54 $2,031.00 $14.44 $2,166.00 $12.16 $1,824.00 $14.07 $2,110.50 $12.93 $1,939.50 $13.00 $1,950.00 $19.60 $2,940.00 $12.87 $1,930.50 $14.32 $2,148.00
150 36x36 $31.03 $4,654.50 $4,654.50 $19.52 $2,928.00 $20.79 $3,118.50 $17.87 $2,680.50 $20.27 $3,040.50 $18.62 $2,793.00 $19.00 $2,850.00 $32.28 $4,842.00 $18.54 $2,781.00 $20.38 $3,057.00

6 Vertical Rectangle
150 12x12 $4.06 $609.00 $609.00 $1.99 $298.50 $2.12 $318.00 $1.96 $294.00 $3.43 $514.50 $2.34 $351.00 $2.00 $300.00 $3.66 $549.00 $1.62 $243.00 $1.96 $294.00
150 12x18 $5.28 $791.70 $792.00 $3.56 $534.00 $3.47 $520.50 $3.04 $456.00 $3.38 $507.00 $3.26 $489.00 $4.00 $600.00 $4.86 $729.00 $3.08 $462.00 $3.52 $528.00
150 12x36 $10.51 $1,576.88 $1,576.50 $5.15 $772.50 $6.36 $954.00 $5.02 $753.00 $8.75 $1,312.50 $6.25 $937.50 $5.00 $750.00 $8.16 $1,224.00 $4.86 $729.00 $5.44 $816.00
150 18x24 $9.99 $1,498.58 $1,498.50 $6.53 $979.50 $6.93 $1,039.50 $5.95 $892.50 $6.76 $1,014.00 $6.25 $937.50 $7.00 $1,050.00 $9.30 $1,395.00 $6.18 $927.00 $6.94 $1,041.00
150 24x30 $17.47 $2,620.88 $2,620.50 $10.84 $1,626.00 $11.55 $1,732.50 $9.77 $1,465.50 $11.26 $1,689.00 $10.34 $1,551.00 $11.00 $1,650.00 $15.78 $2,367.00 $10.31 $1,546.50 $11.39 $1,708.50
150 30x36 $12.85 $1,927.05 $1,927.50 $16.26 $2,439.00 $17.33 $2,599.50 $14.85 $2,227.50 $16.89 $2,533.50 $15.52 $2,328.00 $16.00 $2,400.00 $23.64 $3,546.00 $15.45 $2,317.50 $17.07 $2,560.50
150 12x6 $2.45 $367.58 $367.50 $1.26 $189.00 $1.06 $159.00 $1.37 $205.50 $2.09 $313.50 $1.22 $183.00 $1.00 $150.00 $2.58 $387.00 $0.81 $121.50 $0.99 $148.50

7 Horizontal Rectangle
100 30x24 $17.47 $1,747.25 $1,747.00 $10.90 $1,090.00 $11.55 $1,155.00 $9.77 $977.00 $11.26 $1,689.00 $10.34 $1,034.00 $11.00 $1,100.00 $15.78 $1,578.00 $10.31 $1,031.00 $11.39 $1,139.00
100 36x12 $9.99 $999.05 $999.00 $6.53 $653.00 $6.93 $693.00 $6.25 $625.00 $6.76 $1,014.00 $6.25 $625.00 $7.00 $700.00 $10.32 $1,032.00 $6.18 $618.00 $6.84 $684.00

Aluminum Street Name Assemblies
8 200 Extruded aluminum blades 6x24 $6.28 $1,255.70 $1,256.00 $3.99 $798.00 $3.54 $708.00 $5.79 $1,158.00 $3.84 $768.00 $4.13 $826.00 $6.00 $1,200.00 $5.70 $1,140.00 $5.80 $1,160.00 $5.94 $1,188.00
9 150 Extruded aluminum blades 6x30 $7.61 $1,141.88 $1,141.50 $4.99 $748.50 $4.41 $661.50 $7.12 $1,068.00 $4.80 $720.00 $5.17 $775.50 $8.00 $1,200.00 $7.02 $1,053.00 $7.13 $1,069.50 $7.26 $1,089.00
10 100 Extruded aluminum blades 6x36 $8.85 $884.50 $885.00 $5.99 $599.00 $5.22 $522.00 $8.46 $846.00 $5.76 $576.00 $5.95 $595.00 $9.00 $900.00 $8.40 $840.00 $8.45 $845.00 $8.56 $856.00
11 200 Sign-to-sign brackets $4.45 $890.00 $4.74 $948.30 $948.00 $3.89 $778.00 $4.99 $998.00 $3.00 $600.00 $3.79 $758.00 $7.00 $1,400.00 $3.92 $784.00 $10.53 $2,106.00 $3.63 $726.00
12 200 Post-to-sign brackets $4.56 $912.00 $5.18 $1,035.30 $1,036.00 $4.00 $800.00 $5.26 $1,052.00 $3.00 $600.00 $3.92 $784.00 $7.00 $1,400.00 $4.28 $856.00 $10.53 $2,106.00 $3.83 $766.00
13 150 Channel post-to-sign bracket $4.56 $684.00 $3.90 $585.08 $585.00 $3.84 $576.00 $4.65 $697.50 $3.00 $450.00 $3.74 $561.00 $7.00 $1,050.00 $3.08 $462.00 $10.53 $1,579.50 $3.33 $499.50

Delivery (Days ARO)
Posts

Aluminum Traffic Signs Blanks
Aluminum Street Name Assemblies

Discount

No Bid

*Corrections to submitted extended 
pricing

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

4495 W. Vernal Pike
Bloomington, IN  47404

No Bid

No Bid

1801 Russell Blvd
St. Louis, MO  63104

5100 W. Brown Deer Road
Brown Deer, WI  63223

P.O. Box 54091
Jaxkson, MS  39288-4091

736 Federal Street Suite 2312
Davenport, IA  52803

8225 Estates Parkway
Plain City, OH  43064

790 W. 40 Hwy PMB 119
Blue Springs, MO  64015Frankfort, OH  45628

P.O. Box 1850
Foley, AL  36536-1850

3525 Range Line Rd.
Deckerville, MI  48427

30 - 45
0%

P.O. Box 890
Green Forest, AR  72638

13539 NW Industrial Drive
Bridgeton, MO  63044

11400 W. Addison Ave
Franklin Park, IL  60131

3186 CR550

30 - 45
30 - 45

N/A
30 - 40
N/A

COMPANY
Hall Signs, Inc.

No Bid

No Bid

21
0%

COMPANY
Rocal, Inc.

COMPANY
US Standard Sign

45
0%

N/A
21

45
45

American Sign 
Brackets

N/A
N/A

0%
20

No Bid

No Bid

COMPANY COMPANY
General Sign Company

0%

COMPANY
Vulcan Signs

3 - 14
30

3 - 14
0%

COMPANY
Midwest Rubber 

Co.

Not Indicated
Not Indicated
Not Indicated

0%

COMPANY
MD Solutions

N/A
N/A

14 - 30
0%

COMPANY
J & A Traffic 
Products

10 - 21
N/A
N/A
0%

COMPANY
Custom Products 

Corp.

10 or 45 - 65 Days
30
30
0%

COMPANY
Brown Traffic 
Products

90
21
21
0%

COMPANY
A-1 Sign

30
30
30

1% net 10 Days

COMPANY
Traffic & Parking 

Control

0%

5 - 10
15
15

Prepared by Jenny Morris (314) 839-7621


