
PW10-2943 City of Florissant
Uniforms for City Employees

February 24, 2010

Item Description
1 Pant, Poly/Cotton Blend Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price

Men's Plain Front - Regular Sizes 30 - 42 $17.99 $13.19 28 - 42 $11.50
Larger Sizes 44 - 50 $2.99 $14.19 44 - 60 $13.50

Women's Plain Front - Regular Sizes 4 - 18 $23.05 $12.20 2 - 20 $12.15
Larger Sizes 20 - 22 $26.05 $12.20 22 - 24 $14.95

Men's Pleated Front - Regular Sizes 30 - 42 $27.30 $11.85 28 - 42 $14.95
Larger Sizes 44 - 50 $30.30 $11.85 44 - 52 $17.95

Women's Pleated Front - Regular Sizes 4 - 18 $27.30 $12.95 4 - 18 $14.95
Larger Sizes 20 - 22 $30.30 $12.95 20 - 24 $17.95

Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:

Men's Plain Front

Women's Plain Front

Men's Pleated Front

Women's Pleated Front
Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:
2 Pants, 100% Cotton Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price

Men's Plain Front - Regular Sizes 28 - 42 $21.99 $16.00 28 - 42 $16.95
Larger Sizes 44 - 50 $24.99 $16.00 44 - 56 $19.95

Women's Plain Front - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid 4 - 20 $17.50
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid 22 - 24 $20.95

Men's Pleated Front - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid 28 - 42 $18.95
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid 44 - 50 $22.50

Women's Pleated Front - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid 4 - 20 $18.95
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid 22 - 24 $22.50

Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:

Men's Plain Front
Women's Plain Front
Men's Pleated Front

Women's Pleated Front
Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:
3 Relaxed Fit Jeans Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price

Men's Jeans - Regular Sizes 30 - 44 $23.99 $23.25 30 - 44 $14.25
Larger Sizes 46 - 50 $26.99 $23.25 46 - 60 $15.75

Women's Jeans - Regular Sizes 6 - 18 $23.99 $26.24 4 - 20 $13.95
Larger Sizes 20 - 24 $26.99 $29.74 22 $16.95

Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:

Men's Jeans

Women's Jeans
Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:

COMPANY
G & K Services

Dickies, G&K Direct Purchase Catalog 
#12800
45

none indicated

GK Teamwear, Direct Purchase Catalog 
#14534

Dickies, G&K Direct Purchase Catalog 
#11229

GK Teamwear, G&K Rental Catalog 120-
#346

GK Teamwear, G&K Rental Catalog #1204-
076

GK Teamwear, G&K Rental Catalog #1204-
871
45 

none indicated

GK Teamwear - Direct Purchase Catalog 
#17565
n/a
n/a
n/a
45

none indicated

COMPANY
Aramark

Style 201 Aramark-Wearguard
Style 249 Aramark-Wearguard
Style 1725 Aramark-Wearguard
Style 1728 Aramark-Wearguard

21
spec sheets included with samples

Style 2015 Aramark-Wearguard
n/a
n/a
n/a
21

none indicated

Style 217 Aramark-Wearguard
Style 2274 Aramark-Wearguard

21
none indicated

COMPANY
Image Solutions

Red Kap PT20 - Page 36
Red Kap PT21 - Page 86
Red Kap PT32 - Page 37
Dickies FP220 - Page 8

14
Men's Flat Khaki-waist to 54 - FP220 7 oz. w/ mech 

stretch - Men's pleated Khaki-waist to 50

Red Kap PC20 - Page 39
Red Kap PC45 - Page 91
Red Kap PC46 - Page 44
Red Kap PC47 - No Pic

14
Men's Flat Khaki-waist to 54 - Women's pant 7.5 oz. w/ 

mech stretch

Dickies CR393 - Page 99
Red Kap PD61 - Page 94

14
Women's jean 13.75 oz
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PW10-2943 City of Florissant
Uniforms for City Employees

February 24, 2010

Item Description
COMPANY

G & K Services
COMPANY
Aramark

COMPANY
Image Solutions

4 Carpenter Style Jeans Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price
Men's Jeans - Regular Sizes 30 - 42 $23.99 $24.74 28 - 44 $14.75

Larger Sizes 44 - 50 $29.50 $24.74 46 - 60 $16.50
Women's Jeans - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid 4 - 18 $19.75

Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid 20 - 24 $21.95
Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:

Men's Jeans

Women's Jeans
Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:
5 Women's Strech Jeans Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price

Women's Stretch Jeans - Regular Sizes 6 - 18 $28.58 $26.24 4 - 18 $19.75
Larger Sizes 20 - 24 $31.58 $29.74 20 - 24 $21.95

Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:
Women's Jeans

Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:
Note exceptions to specifications:

6 Shorts. Poly/Cotton Blend Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price
Men's Plain Front - Regular Sizes 28 - 42 $16.99 $11.99 28 - 42 $11.50

Larger Sizes no bid no bid $11.99 44 - 50 $13.50
Women's Plain Front - Regular Sizes no bid no bid $11.99 4 - 20 $11.50

Larger Sizes no bid no bid $11.99 22 $13.50
Men's Pleated Front - Regular Sizes 28 - 42 $18.99 $11.50 30 - 42 $12.95

Larger Sizes no bid no bid $14.00 44 - 50 $15.50
Women's Pleated Front - Regular Sizes 4 - 20 $18.99 $12.50 4 - 20 $12.75

Larger Sizes $12.50 22 $15.25
Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:

Men's Plain Front
Women's Plain Front
Men's Pleated Front

Women's Pleated Front
Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:
7 Shorts. 100% Cotton Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price

Men's Plain Front - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid 28 - 42 $12.95
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid 44 - 50 $15.50

Women's Plain Front - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid 4 - 20 $12.95
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid 22 $15.50

Men's Pleated Front - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid 28 - 42 $18.95
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid 44 - 54 $22.50

Women's Pleated Front - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid 2 - 20 $18.95
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid 22 - 28 $22.50

Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:
Men's Plain Front

Women's Plain Front
Men's Pleated Front

Women's Pleated Front
Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:

n/a
45

none indicated

n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a

none indicated

n/a
n/a

n/a
G&K Teamwear, G&K DP Catalog #24230
G&K Teamwear, G&K DP Catalog #20594

45

G&K Teamwear, G&K DP Catalog # 15847

45
60% Cotton, 40% Poly

Dickies, G&K Rental Catalog #1223-529

Dickies, G&K Direct Purchase Catalog 
#11602

21
none indicated

Style 211 Aramark-Wearguard
n/a

Style 2274 Aramark-Wearguard
21

none indicated

Style 227 Aramark-Wearguard
Aramark-Wearguard Style 1802
Aramark-Wearguard Style 1801
Aramark-Wearguard Style 2261

21
none indicated

n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a

14
Women's jean 13 oz

Dickies LU200 - Page 98
Dickies FP120 - Page 19

Dickies FP113 - Page 18
14

none indicated

Red Kap PT26 - Page 50
Red Kap PT27 - Page 92
Red Kap PT34 - Page 51
Red Kap PT35 - Page 93

14
none indicated

Red Kap PC26 - Page 50
Red Kap PC27 - Page 92
Edwards 2430 - Page 86
Edwards 8439 - Page 86

14
Pleated Shorts are 8 oz.
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PW10-2943 City of Florissant
Uniforms for City Employees

February 24, 2010

Item Description
COMPANY

G & K Services
COMPANY
Aramark

COMPANY
Image Solutions

8 Denim Shirts, 100% Cotton Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price
Men's Long Sleeve - Regular Sizes S - XL $19.99 $15.49 XS - XL $13.50

Larger Sizes 2X - 3XL $22.99 $16.49 2X - 6X $14.95 - 22.95
Women's Long Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid $16.40 XS - XL $13.50

Larger Sizes no bid no bid $18.99 2X / P1X / P2X $14.95 - 18.95
Men's Short Sleeve - Regular Sizes S - XL $17.99 $14.99 XS - XL $13.50

Larger Sizes 2X - 3XL $20.99 $15.45 2X - 6X $14.95 - 22.95
Women's Short Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid $18.99 SXS $13.50

Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid 2X / P1X / P2X $14.95 - 18.95
Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:

Men's Long Sleeve Shirt
Women's Long Sleeve Shirt

Men's Short Sleeve Shirt
Women's Short Sleeve Shirt

Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:
Note exceptions to specifications:

9 Chambray Shirts, 100% Cotton Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price
Men's Long Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid $16.49 S - XL $16.50

Larger Sizes no bid no bid $17.25 2X - 3X $17.75
Women's Long Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Men's Short Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid $16.49 S - XL $15.25

Larger Sizes no bid no bid $17.25 2X - 3X $16.50
Women's Short Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:

Men's Long Sleeve Shirt
Women's Long Sleeve Shirt

Men's Short Sleeve Shirt
Women's Short Sleeve Shirt

Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:
10 Twill Shirts, 100% Cotton Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price

Men's Long Sleeve - Regular Sizes S - XL $19.99 $18.24 XS - XL $16.50
Larger Sizes 2X - 3XL $22.99 $19.59 2X - 8X $17.95 - 29.95

Women's Long Sleeve - Regular Sizes S - XL $19.99 no bid no bid SM - XL $16.50
Larger Sizes 2X - 4XL $22.99 no bid no bid 2X - 4X $17.95 - 20.95

Men's Short Sleeve - Regular Sizes S - XL $17.99 $16.24 XS - XL $16.25
Larger Sizes 2X - 3XL $20.99 $17.99 2X - 7X $17.50 - 29.50

Women's Short Sleeve - Regular Sizes S - XL $17.99 no bid no bid SM - XL $16.25
Larger Sizes 2X - 4XL $20.99 no bid no bid 2X - 4X $17.50 - 20.50

Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:
Men's Long Sleeve Shirt

Women's Long Sleeve Shirt
Men's Short Sleeve Shirt

Women's Short Sleeve Shirt
Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:

G&K Teamwear, GK DP Catalog # 10260

none indicated

G&K Teamwear, GK DP Catalog # 21625
G&K Teamwear, GK DP Catalog # 21526

45

n/a

n/a

G&K Teamwear, GK DP Catalog # 10267

n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a

n/a
45

none indicated

G&K Teamwear, G&K DP Catalog #10411
n/a

G&K Teamwear, G&K DP Catalog #71074

Aramark-Wearguard Style 4091
Aramark-Wearguard Style 4092
Aramark-Wearguard Style 4090
Aramark-Wearguard Style 4093

21
Women's short sleeve size range is XS - XL

Aramark-Wearguard Style 124
n/a

Aramark-Wearguard Style 197
n/a
21

light blue only

Aramark-Wearguard Style 1221
n/a

Aramark-Wearguard Style 1218
n/a
21

color white is special request - can obtain

Port & Company P10 - Page 29
Port & Company LSP10 - Page 29
Port & Company SP11 - Page 30
Port & Company LSP11 - Page 31

14
includes emb. - $3.00 logo chg

Dickies 1145573 - Page 48
n/a

Dickies 1141573 - Page 48
n/a
14

Includes emb. - $3.00 logo chg / Talls Avail. / 60140 
Blend-Blue Only

Blue Generation BG8213 - Page 44-45
Blue Generation BG6213 - Page 44-45
Blue Generation BG82135 - Page 44-45
Blue Generation BG62135 - Page 44-45

14
includes emb. - $3.00 logo chg
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PW10-2943 City of Florissant
Uniforms for City Employees

February 24, 2010

Item Description
COMPANY

G & K Services
COMPANY
Aramark

COMPANY
Image Solutions

11 Work Shirts, Poly/Cotton Blend Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price
Men's Long Sleeve - Regular Sizes S - XL $19.99 $13.25 S - XL $11.50

Larger Sizes 2X - 3XL $22.99 $13.99 2X - 5X $13.50
Women's Long Sleeve - Regular Sizes S - XL $19.99 no bid no bid S - XL $13.25

Larger Sizes 2XL $22.99 no bid no bid S - 3X $15.25
Men's Short Sleeve - Regular Sizes S - XL $17.99 $12.50 S - XL $10.25

Larger Sizes 2X - 3XL $20.99 $12.99 2X - 6X $11.95
Women's Short Sleeve - Regular Sizes S - XL $17.99 $16.12 S - XL $11.50

Larger Sizes 2XL $20.99 no bid no bid 2X - 4X $12.95
Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:

Men's Long Sleeve Shirt

Women's Long Sleeve Shirt
Men's Short Sleeve Shirt

Women's Short Sleeve Shirt
Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:
12 Work Shirts, 100% Cotton Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price

Men's Long Sleeve - Regular Sizes S - XL $18.99 $15.99 S - XL $15.95
Larger Sizes 2X - 3XL $21.99 $15.99 2X - 5X $18.50

Women's Long Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Men's Short Sleeve - Regular Sizes S - XL $16.99 $15.99 S - XL $14.50
Larger Sizes 2X - 3XL $21.99 $15.99 2X - 4X $16.95

Women's Short Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:
Men's Long Sleeve Shirt

Women's Long Sleeve Shirt
Men's Short Sleeve Shirt

Women's Short Sleeve Shirt
Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:
13 Polo Shirts, Poly/Cotton Pique Blend Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price

Men's Long Sleeve - Regular Sizes S - XL $19.99 $16.55 S - XL $16.50
Larger Sizes 2X - 3XL $21.99 $16.55 2X - 6X $17.75 - 29.75

Women's Long Sleeve - Regular Sizes S - XL $19.99 S - XL $16.50
Larger Sizes 2X - 4XL $21.99 2X - 4X $17.75 - 20.50

Men's Short Sleeve - Regular Sizes S - XL $16.99 $14.99 S - XL $12.50
Larger Sizes 2X - 3XL $18.99 $14.99 2X - 10X $13.50 - 22.50

Women's Short Sleeve - Regular Sizes S - XL $16.99 $12.99 XS - XL $12.50
Larger Sizes 2X - 4XL $18.99 $12.99 2X - 4X $13.50 - 15.50

Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:
Men's Long Sleeve Shirt

Women's Long Sleeve Shirt
Men's Short Sleeve Shirt

Women's Short Sleeve Shirt
Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:

G&K Teamwear, GK DP Catalog #11416
G&K Teamwear, GK DP Catalog #12685

45
none indicated

G&K Teamwear, GK DP Catalog #12686
G&K Teamwear, GK DP Catalog #11290

n/a
45

none indicated

n/a
G&K Teamwear, G&K DP Catalog #33219

45
none indicated

G&K Teamwear, G&K DP Catalog #31502

G&K Teamwear, G&K DP Catalog #19483
G&K Teamwear, G&K Rental Catalog 

#1010-346
G&K Teamwear, G&K DP Catalog #26149
G&K Teamwear, G&K Rental Catalog 

#1010-346

Aramark-Wearguard Style 101

n/a
Aramark-Wearguard Style 102

Aramark-Wearguard Style 162
21

women's short sleeve reg size range is S - XL

Aramark-Wearguard Style 1005
n/a

Aramark-Wearguard Style 1019
n/a
21

none indicated

Aramark-Wearguard Style 12120
n/a

Aramark-Wearguard Style 11120
Aramark-Wearguard Style 12238

21
none indicated

Red Kap SP14 - Page 6-9

Red Kap SP13 - Page 80
Red Kap SP24 - Page 6-9

Red Kap SP23 - Page 80
14

Includes emb. - $3.00 logo chg / Long & x-long tails and 
sleeve lengths avail in men's

Red Kap SC30 - Page 10
n/a

Red Kap SC40 - Page 10
n/a
14

Includes emb. - $3.00 logo chg / White avail to 3XL on 
both long and short sleeve

Blue Generation BG7207 - Page 24-25
Blue Generation BG6207 - Page 24-25
Blue Generation BG7204 - Page 20-21
Blue Generation BG6204 - Page 20-21

14
Includes emb. - $3.00 logo chg / avail with pocket - see 

bid pages for specs
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PW10-2943 City of Florissant
Uniforms for City Employees

February 24, 2010

Item Description
COMPANY

G & K Services
COMPANY
Aramark

COMPANY
Image Solutions

14 Henley Shirts, 100% Cotton Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price
Men's Long Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Women's Long Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Men's Short Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid $15.99 S - XL $10.50

Larger Sizes no bid no bid $18.99 2X - 3X $13.50
Women's Short Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:

Men's Long Sleeve Shirt
Women's Long Sleeve Shirt

Men's Short Sleeve Shirt
Women's Short Sleeve Shirt

Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:
15 Tee-Shirts Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price

Men's Long Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid S - XL $9.50
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid 2X - 4X $11.50

Women's Long Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid SM - XL $8.95
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid 2X $10.50

Men's Short Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid $15.99 S - XL $6.95
Larger Sizes no bid no bid $18.99 2X - 5X $8.95

Women's Short Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid S - XL $5.95
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid 2X - 3X $7.50

Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:
Men's Long Sleeve Shirt

Women's Long Sleeve Shirt
Men's Short Sleeve Shirt

Women's Short Sleeve Shirt
Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:
16 Women's Tee Shirts Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price

Scoop Neck Long Sleeve - Regular Sizes S - XL $17.99 no bid no bid
Larger Sizes 2XL $19.99 no bid no bid

Scoop Neck - 3/4 Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid

Scoop Neck Short Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid $8.60
Larger Sizes no bid no bid $9.60

V-neck Long Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid

V-neck - 3/4 Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid

V-neck Short Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid

Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:
Scoop Neck Long Sleeve Shirt
Scoop Neck - 3/4 Sleeve Shirt
Scoop Neck Short Sleeve Shirt

V-neck Long Sleeve Shirt
V-neck - 3/4 Sleeve Shirt

V-neck - Short Sleeve Shirt
Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

n/a
n/a
n/a

45
n/a
n/a

n/a

n/a

G&K Direct Purchase Catalog #13609

n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a

n/a
n/a
n/a

n/a
n/a
n/a

n/a
n/a

Anvil Style 1202 White, navy, heathergrey, 
see spec sheet

n/a
14 - 21

none indicated

Aramark-Gildon Style GN 2410
n/a

Aramark-Gildon Style GN 2300
n/a
21

none indicated

n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a

14 - 21

n/a
n/a

Anvil 1202 - Page 135
n/a
14

Includes Screen Logo ($1.50) - Embroidered Logo add 
$1.50

Gildon 2410 - Page 113
Gildon 2400L - Page 113
Gildon 2300 - Page 112
Gildon 2000L - Page 111

14
Includes Screen Logo ($1.50) - Embroidered Logo add 

$1.50 / Women's no pocet and not offered in long 
sleeve orange

See Item 17

There are dozens of similar combinations in 
this fabric with similar pricing

14
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PW10-2943 City of Florissant
Uniforms for City Employees

February 24, 2010

Item Description
COMPANY

G & K Services
COMPANY
Aramark

COMPANY
Image Solutions

Note exceptions to specifications: none indicated none indicated
Includes Screen Logo ($1.50) - Embroidered Logo add 

$1.50

Prepared by Jenny Morris (314) 839-7621 6 of 9



PW10-2943 City of Florissant
Uniforms for City Employees

February 24, 2010

Item Description
COMPANY

G & K Services
COMPANY
Aramark

COMPANY
Image Solutions

17 Women's Coordinates Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price
Knit Top - 3/4 Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid XS - XL $14.95

Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid 2X / P1X / P2X $15.50 - 19.75
Knit top Short Sleeve - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid XS - XL $12.75

Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid 2X / P1X / P2X $14.25 - 18.25
Cardigan Long Sleeve - Regular Sizes S - XL $24.99 no bid no bid XS - XL $18.25

Larger Sizes 2XL $26.99 no bid no bid 2X / P1X / P2X $19.75 - 23.95
Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:

Knit Top - 3/4 Sleeve
Knit Top Short Sleeve
Cardigan Long Sleeve

Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:
18 Wind-Shirts Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price

Men's Long Sleeve Shirt - Regular Sizes S - XL $26.99 $27.99 XS - XL $19.25
Larger Sizes 2X - 3XL $31.99 $27.99 2X - 6X $20.50

Women's Short Sleeve Shirt - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:

Men's Long Sleeve Shirt
Women's Long Sleeve Shirt

Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:
19 Crew Neck Sweatshirts, Poly/Cotton Blend Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price

Men's Long Sleeve Shirt - Regular Sizes S - XL $11.99 $17.99 S - XL $12.50
Larger Sizes 2X - 3XL $14.99 $18.99 2X - 4X $13.95 - 14.50

Women's Short Sleeve Shirt - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:
Men's Long Sleeve Shirt

Women's Long Sleeve Shirt
Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:
20 Hooded Sweatshirt, Poly/Cotton Blend Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price

Men's Long Sleeve Shirt - Regular Sizes no bid no bid $23.10 XS - XL $17.95
Larger Sizes no bid no bid $23.10 2X - 4X $19.25 - 21.95

Women's Short Sleeve Shirt - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:
Men's Long Sleeve Shirt

Women's Long Sleeve Shirt
Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:

21
Hooded Sweatshirt, Poly/Cotton Blend, Zipper 

Enclosure Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price
Men's Long Sleeve Shirt - Regular Sizes S - XL $23.99 $24.10 XS - XL $23.25

Larger Sizes 2XL $26.99 $24.10 2X - 4X $24.50 - 28.75
Women's Short Sleeve Shirt - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid S - XL $20.50

Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid 2X - 3X $23.50
Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:

Men's Long Sleeve Shirt
Women's Long Sleeve Shirt

Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days: 45

Indigo Blue not Available

GK Teamwear, GK DP Catalog #46733
n/a

Orange Unavailable

n/a
n/a

n/a

GK Teamwear, GK Direct Purchase #11040
n/a
45

n/a
n/a

G&K Direct Purchase Catalog #11315

GK Teamwear , GK DP Catalog #56055

45

100% Egyptian Cotton

n/a
n/a

n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a

n/a

Aramark-Wearguard Style 1953
n/a
12

Sizes S - 5X

Aramark-Wearguard Style 1285
n/a
21

none indicated

Aramark-Wearguard Style 3385
n/a
21

none indicated

Aramark-Wearguard Style 3386
n/a
21

Port Authority L517
Port Authority L516
Port Authority L515

14
Includes Screen Logo ($1.50) - Embroidered Logo add 
$1.50 / variety of blues / whispering pines#20,#21,#22-

alternative for Navy

Colorado Timberline WSG - Page 28
n/a
14

Includes Screen Logo ($1.50) - Embroidered Logo add 
$1.50 / Badger #7618 Alternate for Indigo

Port & Company PC90 - Page 322
n/a
14

Includes Emb. Logo ($3.00)

Port & Company PC90H - Page 322
n/a
14

Includes Emb. Logo ($3.00)

Sport-Tek F258 - Page 316
Hanes W280 - Page 283

14
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Uniforms for City Employees

February 24, 2010

Item Description
COMPANY

G & K Services
COMPANY
Aramark

COMPANY
Image Solutions

Note exceptions to specifications:
22 Insulated Overalls Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price

Men's Overalls - Regular Sizes no bid no bid $59.99 S - XL $42.75
Larger Sizes no bid no bid $59.99 2X - 5X $46.95

Women's Overalls - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:
Men's Overalls

Women's Overalls
Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:
23 Insulated Winter Coat Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price

Men's Coat - Regular Sizes no bid no bid $48.00 M - XL $39.95
Larger Sizes no bid no bid $48.00 2X - 5X $43.75

Women's Coat - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:
Men's Coat

Women's Coat
Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:
24 Insulated Coveralls Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price

Men's Coveralls - Regular Sizes no bid no bid $85.49 S - XL $64.95
Larger Sizes no bid no bid $85.49 2X - 5X $68.95

Women's Coveralls - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:
Men's Coveralls

Women's Coveralls
Maximum Lead Time Required for Delivery in Calendar 

Days:
Note exceptions to specifications:

25 Three-Season Jacket Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price
Men's Jacket - Regular Sizes no bid no bid $38.49 S - XL $36.50

Larger Sizes no bid no bid 2X - 5X $38.49 2X - 6X $38.75 - 49.50
Women's Jacket - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid XS - XL $36.50

Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid 2X - 4X $38.75 - 44.25
Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:

Men's Jacket
Women's Jacket

Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:
26 Water-Resistant Fleece Jacket Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price

Men's Jacket - Regular Sizes no bid no bid $35.49 XS - XL $21.95
Larger Sizes no bid no bid $35.49 2X - 6X $23.25

Women's Jacket - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid XXS - XL $20.55
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid 2X - 5X $21.95

Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:
Men's Jacket

Women's Jacket
Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:

n/a

n/a
n/a

n/a

Orange Unavailable

n/a
n/a

n/a
n/a

n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a

n/a
n/a
n/a

n/a

n/a
n/a
n/a

n/a

none indicated

Aramark-Wearguard Style 328
n/a
21

none indicated

Aramark-Wearguard Style 1907
n/a
21

none indicated

Aramark-Wearguard Style 325
n/a
21

none indicated

Aramark-Wearguard Style 401
n/a
21

Larger Size 2X - 5X

Aramark-Wearguard Style 2943
n/a
21

none indicated

Includes Emb. Logo ($3.00) / Women's is 8 oz. weight 
and no orange

Dickies TB839 - Page 79
n/a
14

none indicated

Dickies 77-239 - Page 81
n/a
14

Includes Emb. Logo ($3.00) / 10 oz. duck shell with 6 
oz. fill

Dickies TV239/T239 - Page 79
n/a
14

Includes Emb. Logo ($3.00)

Tri Mountain 8800 - Page 100/111
Tri Mountain 8820 - Page 109

14
Includes Emb. Logo ($3.00) / Women's has open 
bottom & not avail. In khaki / Tall sizes are also 

available in men's

Colorado Timberline HJF - Page 74
Colorado Timberline WJF - Page 106

14
Includes Emb. Logo ($3.00) / Ladies not offered in 
charcoal & Indigo /' Men's 1/4 zip pullover - HPF
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PW10-2943 City of Florissant
Uniforms for City Employees

February 24, 2010

Item Description
COMPANY

G & K Services
COMPANY
Aramark

COMPANY
Image Solutions

27 Rainwear Parka and/or Pants Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price
Men's Rainwear Parka - Regular Sizes no bid no bid $22.99 no bid no bid

Larger Sizes no bid no bid $22.99 no bid no bid
Men's Rainwear Pants - Regular Sizes no bid no bid $14.99 no bid no bid

Larger Sizes no bid no bid $14.99 no bid no bid
Women's Rainwear Parka - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Women's Rainwear Pants - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:

Men's Rainwear Parka
Men's Rainwear Pants

Women's Rainwear Parka
Women's Rainwear Pants

Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:
28 Knit Cap or Face Mask Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price

Stocking Cap - Regular Sizes no bid no bid $7.49 OSFA $6.50
Larger Sizes no bid no bid $7.49 no bid no bid

Face Mask - Regular Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:
Stocking Cap
Face Mask

Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:
Note exceptions to specifications:

29 Insulated Work Gloves Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price
Insulated Work Gloves - Regular Sizes no bid no bid $5.75 $3.50 - 5.00

Larger Sizes no bid no bid $5.75 no bid no bid
Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:

Insulated Work Gloves
Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:
30 Baseball Cap Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price Sizes Delivered Price

Adjustable Cap - Regular Sizes no bid no bid $8.99 OSFM $6.95
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Fitted Cap - Regular Sizes no bid no bid $11.99 OSFM $8.95
Larger Sizes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Manufacturer's names, brand, and catalog item number:
Adjustable Cap

Fitted Cap
Max Lead Time Req for Delivery in Calendar Days:

Note exceptions to specifications:

31
Discount Percentage on special orders over and above 

the standard bid items:
Cash Discount

n/a
n/a

n/a
n/a

n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a

n/a
n/a
n/a

n/a
n/a

n/a
n/a
n/a

n/a

None Indicated

0%

Aramark-Wearguard Style 832
Aramark-Wearguard Style 833

n/a
n/a
21

need to be bulk ordered - 12 pc min for screen print

Aramark-Wearguard Style 1984
n/a
21

none indicated

Aramark-Wearguard Style 7818
21

none indicated

Aramark-Wearguard Style 1697
Aramark-Wearguard Style 1658

21
none indicated

10%

0%

n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a

I-K657
n/a
14

Includes Emb. Log ($3.00) on stocking cap

Variou Brands - Not Exact Match
14

99701
Flex-Fit

0%

14
none indicated

same mark up on special order items as bid 
items
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