
PW10-2926 CONSTRUCTION AND MAINTENANCE MATERIALS NOVEMBER 12, 2009

Qty Description Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered

1 2400 CY
Portland Cement Concrete 
w/Limestone Stone

a 6 1/2 Sack with Meramec Sand No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $73.50 $73.50 $73.50 $73.50 $69.45 $69.45 $71.50 $71.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
b 6 1/2 Sack with River Sand No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $71.00 $71.00 $71.00 $71.00 $67.45 $67.45 $69.00 $69.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
c 6 1/2 Sack with All Purpose Sand No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $73.50 $73.50 $73.50 $73.50 $69.45 $69.45 $71.50 $71.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 2400 CY
Portland Cement Concrete 
w/Meramec Gravel

a 6 1/2 Sack with Meramec Sand No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $73.50 $73.50 $73.50 $73.50 $69.45 $69.45 $72.00 $72.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
b 6 1/2 Sack with River Sand No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $71.00 $71.00 $71.00 $71.00 $67.45 $67.45 $69.50 $69.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
c 6 1/2 Sack with All Purpose Sand No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $73.50 $73.50 $73.50 $73.50 $69.45 $69.45 $72.00 $72.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 Asphaltic Concrete
a 1300 T Type C No Bid No Bid $41.00 $46.20 $41.00 $45.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
b 100 T Type X No Bid No Bid $41.00 $46.20 $41.00 $45.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
c 100 T Type D No Bid No Bid $41.00 $46.20 $41.00 $45.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
d 100 T Type E (curb mix) No Bid No Bid $55.00 $60.20 $56.00 $60.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
e 100 T Cold Mix UPM No Bid No Bid $95.50 $100.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid $104.00 $113.00 No Bid No Bid

4 Crushed Stone
a 4000 T Type 1 -1 inch Minus $5.10 $8.30 $4.30 $8.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
b 100 T Type 1 -1 1/2 inch Minus $5.00 $8.20 $4.30 $8.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
c 400 T Type 1 - 2 inch Minus $5.00 $8.20 $4.30 $8.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
d 100 T Rip Rap (1 man) $11.50 $15.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
e 500 T Screening $3.25 $6.45 $3.40 $7.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
f 300 T 1 inch Clean $9.00 $12.20 $9.75 $13.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
g 300 T 1/2" Clean $9.00 $12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
h 300 T 1/2" Minus $6.00 $9.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sand:
i-1 100 T River $6.20 $9.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
i-2 100 T Meramec No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
j 100 T Top Dressing Sand No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid $7.95 $13.80
k 100 T Pea Gravel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 Liquid Asphalt
a 2000 10-gal MC-30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid $4.10 $4.22 No Bid No Bid
b 2000 10-gal 85-100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid $3.99 $4.11 No Bid No Bid
c 2000 10-gal 70-85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid $3.99 $4.11 No Bid No Bid
d 2000 10-gal AC-20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid $3.99 $4.11 No Bid No Bid

Discount 3%0%

Pace Construction

0% 0%

Central Stone Fred Weber

0% 0%

Eastern Mo.ConcreteKienstra Metro Materials
COMPANYCOMPANY COMPANYCOMPANY COMPANY COMPANY COMPANY COMPANYCOMPANY

Breckenridge Materials

0%0%

Missouri Petroleum

0%

Quality Sand

Prepared by Jenny Morris


