
PW09-2921 City of Florissant
New Streetlights - Paddock Estates

November 19, 2009

Item Qty Description Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
1 10 each New "Boulevard" style streetlights, installed No Bid No Bid $7,373.63 $73,736.30 $5,950.00 $59,500.00 No Bid No Bid
2 4 each New "Heritage" style streetlights, installed No Bid No Bid $4,629.27 $18,517.08 $2,075.00 $8,300.00 No Bid No Bid
3 4 each New "Portfolio" style deck lights, installed No Bid No Bid $4,740.00 $18,960.00 $750.00 $3,000.00 No Bid No Bid
4 2 each New "Heritage" style wall lights, installed No Bid No Bid $4,636.53 $9,273.06 $1,065.00 $2,130.00 No Bid No Bid
5 1 each New flood light, installed No Bid No Bid $4,640.00 $4,640.00 $600.00 $600.00 No Bid No Bid
6 22 each Modify existing "Boulevard" streetlights No Bid No Bid $1,516.03 $33,352.66 $710.00 $15,620.00 No Bid No Bid

Total No Bid $158,479.10 $89,150.00 No Bid
7 Federal Apprenticeship Policy

1A 10 each New "Boulevard" style streetlights, installed $6,548.70 $65,487.00 No Bid No Bid $5,850.00 $58,500.00 $2,900.00 $29,000.00
2A 4 each New "Heritage" style streetlights, installed $4,260.50 $17,042.00 No Bid No Bid $2,025.00 $8,100.00 $995.00 $3,980.00
3A 4 each New "Portfolio" style deck lights, installed $3,900.75 $15,603.00 No Bid No Bid $730.00 $2,920.00 $175.00 $700.00
4A 2 each New "Heritage" style wall lights, installed $2,732.00 $5,464.00 No Bid No Bid $1,025.00 $2,050.00 $430.00 $860.00
5A 1 each New flood light, installed $3,867.00 $3,867.00 No Bid No Bid $600.00 $600.00 $580.00 $580.00
6A 22 each Modify existing "Boulevard" streetlights $3,715.41 $81,739.02 No Bid No Bid $610.00 $13,420.00 $627.00 $13,794.00

Total $189,202.02 No Bid $85,590.00 * $168,825.00
7A Federal Apprenticeship Policy

Discount
* Total includes additional 
cost for wire and service 
installation: $119,911.00

Company

5%

Strieb Electric

0%

Alternate 120-Volt System
N/A

100%

Company

Reinhold Electric

72%

72%
0%

Company

T-R-E Electric

100%

N/A

Company

Bell Electrical Cont.

N/A

100%
N/A

Prepared by Jenny Morris (314) 839-7621


