PW09-2920

City of Florissant
Enhancements at Nature Lodge

November 3, 2009

Prepared Jenny Morris

Company Company Company Company
Dura Seal Paving Gershenson Construction Ford Asphalt Co., Inc. NB West Contracting
Item Description Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
1 Asphalt Parking Lot $3.50 / sf $46,000.00 $35,140.00 $38,350.00 $24.75 | sy $36,555.00
2 Concrete Back Patio $32.00 / sf $25,000.00 $15,270.00 $13,000.00 $113.00/ sy $9,718.00
3 Asphalt Service Road $3.50 / sf $10,500.00 $10,820.00 $10,850.00 $55.60 / sy $17,958.00
4 Federal Apprenticeship Policy 100% 80% 100% 100%
Discount 0% 0% 0% 0%
(CONTINUED) Company Company Company
County Asphalt Paving Co., Inc. Busy Bee Paving Southern Ditching & Excavating
Item Description Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
1 Asphalt Parking Lot $34,057.01 $23.80 / sy $35,176.40 No Bid No Bid
2 Concrete Back Patio $14,916.41 $8.41 / sf $6,559.80 $15,790.000 $15,790.00
3 Asphalt Service Road $10,792.74 $24.00 / sy $7,752.00 No Bid No Bid
4 Federal Apprenticeship Policy 100% 100% 100%
Discount 0% $800.00 1% - 10 Days




