PW09-2913 CITY OF FLORISSANT August 28,2009
ELECTRICAL MATERIALS AND SUPPLIES
COMPANY COMPANY
Metro Electric French Gerleman
Description/Qty
1|WIRE & CABLE
Type THHN - THWN
Size
14 Solid price per 500 ft. $26.90 $30.33
14 Stranded price per 500 ft, $30.26 $31.04
12 Solid price per 500 ft. $33.18 $45.03
12 Stranded price per 500 ft, $41.00 $44.58
10 Stranded price per 500 ft. $62.00 $67.37
10 Solid price per 500 ft. $60.00 $70.74
Type SO Cord - 600 Volt
Size
14-3 price per ft. $0.37 $0.3341
12-3 price per ft. $0.52 $0.4963
10-3 price per ft. $0.74 $0.6554
Type BX Cable
12-2 price per ft. $0.34 $0.4506
12-2 price per 250 ft. $83.77 $112.66
TYPE CABLE (1,000 ft) (1,000 ft)
Plenum Rated CAT.5E $178.00 $191.95
2|EMT-GREENFIELD-LIQUID-TIGHT CONDUIT
Type EMT
1/2" price per 100 ft $14.68 $15.09
3/4" price per 100 ft. $28.21 $29.29
Type Greenfield
3/8" price per 100 ft. $26.88 $28.59
1/2" price per 100 ft. $34.52 $33.11
3/4" price per 100 ft. $37.06 $45.54
Type E.F. Sealtite
3/8" price per ft. $0.69 $0.3822
1/2" price per ft. $0.81 $0.4401
3/4" price per ft. $1.08 $0.5675
Liquid-tight straight connectors
3/8" price per ctn. of 25 $45.75 $35.62
1/2" price per ctn. of 25 $45.75 $41.33
3/4" price per ctn. of 25 $63.25 $55.16
Liquid-tight 90 angel connectors
3/8" price per ctn. of 25 $68.25 $56.16
1/2" price per ctn. of 25 $68.50 $64.87
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COMPANY COMPANY
Metro Electric French Gerleman
Description/Qty
3/4" price per ctn. of 25 $106.25 $88.60
Set screw EMT couplings
1/2" price per ctn. of 50 $7.66 $10.29
3/4" price per ctn. of 25 $5.95 $8.20
Set screw EMT connectors
1/2" price per ctn. of 50 $5.94 $9.27
3/4" price per ctn. of 25 $4.83 $7.57
Squeeze type BX of FLEX connectors
3/8" price per ctn. of 50 $19.73 $19.18
1/2" price per ctn. of 50 $21.27 $25.55
3/4" price per ctn. of 25 $18.52 $17.31
90 Angle squeeze type BX or FLEX connectors
3/8" price per ctn. of 50 $26.34 $24.79
1/2" price per ctn. of 50 $36.07 $37.07
3/4" price per ctn. of 25 $48.30 $28.57
Compression Connectors
1/2" price per ctn. of 25 $5.67 $8.03
3/4" price per ctn. of 25 $7.82 $13.29
Compression Couplings
1/2" price per ctn. of 20 $5.46 $9.59
3/4" price per ctn. of 20 $7.60 $12.84
90 Corner Pulling Ells
1/2" price per ctn. of 10 $28.47 $26.46
3/4" price per ctn. of 10 $32.77 $23.32
One Hole Steel EMT Straps
1/2" price per ctn. of 100 $7.54 $8.20
3/4" price per ctn. of 100 $12.01 $10.29
Galvanized Steel Hangers
1/2" price per ctn. of 100 $30.99 $15.37
3/4" price per ctn. of 100 $35.68 $17.76
3(CONDUIT BODIES
Type C (with covers & gaskets)
1/2" price each $1.95 $2.69
3/4" price each $4.00 $3.47
Type LB
1/2" price each $1.95 $2.60
3/4" price each $2.49 $3.39
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ELECTRICAL MATERIALS AND SUPPLIES
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Metro Electric French Gerleman
Description/Qty
Type LL
1/2" price each $1.95 $2.68
3/4" price each $2.49 $3.47
Type LR
1/2" price each $2.91 $2.68
3/4" price each $3.48 $3.47
Type T
1/2" price each $2.25 $3.43
3/4" price each $3.80 $4.44
Conduit Body Covers: Aluminum
1/2" price each $0.63 $0.78
3/4" price each $1.19 $1.11
Conduit Body Cover Gaskets - Solid Vellum
1/2" price each $0.73 $1.85
3/4" price each $0.86 $1.85
HANDY BOXES
1/2" K.O. 1 1/2" deep price each $1.18 $0.60
1/2" K.0. 2 1/2" deep price each $1.38 $0.97
3/4"K.0. 1 1/2" deep price each n/a $0.80
3/4" K.0. 2 1/2" deep price each $1.54 $1.26
1/2" K.O. extension price each $1.90 $1.40
3/4" K.O. extension price each $1.95 $2.63
Handy Box Covers
Blank price each $0.30 $0.29
Duplex Receptable price each $0.34 $0.29
Toggle switch price each $0.36 $0.79
4" Octagon Boxes
1/2" K.O. price each $0.82 $0.81
3/4" K.O. price each $2.22 $0.84
Extension Rings
1/2" K.O. price each $1.37 $1.41
3/4" K.O. price each $2.75 $1.90
4" Octagon Box Covers
Flat blank price each $0.45 $0.27
Duplex Receptable price each $1.50 $1.20
4" Square Boxes
1/2" K.O. price each $0.91 $1.03
3/4" K.O. price each $1.06 $0.79
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Description/Qty
4" Square Surface Covers
Toggle switch price each $1.33 $0.79
Duplex receptable price each $1.30 $0.78
Two Duplex receptacle price each $1.30 $0.99
Flat blank price each $0.30 $0.28
Single Gang Weatherproof Boxes
1/2" K.O. price each $3.04 $2.79
3/4" K.O. price each $3.50 $3.57
Weatherproof duplex cover price each $3.71 $9.52
Weatherproof switch cover price each $4.25 $6.86
5|CHALLENGER CIRCUIT BREAKERS
20 Amp 1 pole 1/2" price each $3.82 No Bid
20 Amp 2 pole 1" price each n/a No Bid
20 Amp 1 pole 1" price each $3.82 No Bid
20 Amp 2 pole 2" price each $9.35 No Bid
GFIC Breaker
20 Amp price each $37.65 No Bid
6|FUSES
FRS-R10 600 Volt price per box of 10 $7.51 $98.02
FRS-R15 600 Volt price per box of 10 $6.82 $86.53
FRS-R20 600 Volt price per box of 10 $6.82 $86.53
FRS-R30 600 Volt price per box of 10 $6.69 $86.53
FRS R175 600 Volt price each $48.44 $61.33
FRS R200 600 Volt price each $48.44 $61.33
FRS R400 600 Volt price each $96.85 $122.65
KRP-C-800SP 600 Volt price each $415.89 $433.43
7|CRIMP TYPE TERMINALS
Ring Tongue Vinyl Insulated $16.38
Wire range 16-14 stud size 6-8-10 price per 100 $20.96 $32.59
Wire range 12-10 stud size 6-8-10 price per 100 $14.33 $40.09
Block Fork Vinyl Insulated $13.48
Wire range 22-18 stud size 8 price per 100 $17.59 $29.08
Wire range 16-14 stud size 8 price per 100 $13.48 $28.31
Wire range 12-10 stud size 10 price per 100 $13.48 $36.55
1/4" Female Quick-Slide Terminals Vinyl Insulated
Wire range 22-18 price per 100 $13.48 $37.17
Wire range 16-14 price per 100 $13.48 $36.51
Wire range 12-10 price per 100 $17.56 $50.30
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ELECTRICAL MATERIALS AND SUPPLIES
COMPANY COMPANY
Metro Electric French Gerleman
Description/Qty
1/4" Male Quick-Slide Terminals Vinyl Insulated
Wire range 22-18 price per 100 $16.55 $36.22
Wire range 16-14 price per 100 $16.55 $40.23
Wire range 12-10 price per 100 $18.10 $45.17
Vinyl insulated Butt Connectors w/Grip
Wire range 22-18 price per 100 $13.48 $38.49
Wire range 16-14 price per 100 $13.48 $39.25
Wire range 12-10 price per 100 $13.90 $44.06
8|VINYL ELECTRICAL TAPE PRICE PER ROLL $0.69
9|WIRE NUTS
Dark Grey price per 100 $5.11 $4.54
Orange price per 100 $5.77 $5.49
Yellow price per 100 $4.12 $6.34
Red price per 100 $4.71 $10.14
Light Grey price per 50 $13.68 $9.09
10(WIRING DEVICES
Switches
2-Pole lock type 20 Amp 277 Volt price each $16.76 $19.89
3-Way lock tYpe 20 Amp 277 Volt price each $16.76 $19.31
2-Pole toggle type 20 Amp 120 Volt price each $8.25 $14.48
3-Way toggle type 20 Amp 120 Volt price each $3.18 $13.39
11(DUPLEX RECEPTABLES
20 Amp 125 Volt price each $0.94 $0.90
20 Amp 125 Volt Isolated Ground price each $4.18 $7.87
20 Amp 125 Volt GFI price each $9.41 $9.77
12(THREE WIRE GROUNDING CAPS AND CONNECTORS
Dead Front-Back Wired 20 Amp Plug price each $11.53 $11.84
20 Amp Dual Range Cord Grip Connector price each $9.72 $19.71
13|STANDARD WALL PLATES
1 toggle switch price each $0.17 $0.16
2 toggle switches price each $0.37 $0.32
1 duplex receptable price each $0.17 $0.16
2 duplex receptable price each $0.37 $0.32
1 Gang Blank price each $0.17 $1.05
2 Gang Blank price each $2.46 $2.10
Polished Chrome
1 toggle switch price each $1.08 $0.97
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ELECTRICAL MATERIALS AND SUPPLIES
COMPANY COMPANY
Metro Electric French Gerleman
Description/Qty
2 toggle switches price each $2.15 $1.97
1 Gang Blank price each $1.08 $0.97
2 Gang Blank price each $4.25 $1.77
14(FLUORESCENT BALLASTS
2-40 watt T-12 Rapid start 120 volt price each $11.69 $14.37
2-40 watt T-12 Rapid start 277 volt price each $15.49 $14.37
F-40 Watt T-8 Electronic Ballast 120/277 Volt $17.39 $15.02
15[HIGH PRESSURE SODIUM OUTDOOR LIGHT FIXTURE
50 Watt HPS Wal-Pak price each $61.57 $62.07
70 Watt HPS Wal-Pak price each $61.57 $62.07
100 Watt HPS Wal-Pak price each $160.47 $167.47
150 Watt HPS Wal-Pak price each $160.47 $170.69
200 Watt HPS Wal-Pak price each n/a $183.56
250 Watt HPS Trunion Mount price each $209.00 $270.34
400 Watt HPS Trunion Mount price each $212.00 $275.34
High Pressure Sodium Lamps
50 Watt HPS Medium Base price each $17.99 $17.46
70 Watt HPS Medium Base price each $15.07 $14.72
100 Watt HPS Mogul Base price each $15.07 $14.72
150 Watt HPS Mogul Base price each $15.07 $14.72
200 Watt HPS Mogul Base price each $19.00 $14.87
250 Watt HPS Mogul Base price each $15.07 $14.72
400 Watt HPS Mogul Base price each $15.07 $14.72
High Pressure Sodium Ballasts - Multi Tap
50 Watt price each $82.39 $61.18
70 Watt price each $84.55 $59.45
100 Watt price each $88.88 $53.78
150 Watt price each $88.88 $60.21
200 Watt price each $107.00 $180.45
250 Watt price each $107.00 $67.87
400 Watt price each $118.00 $74.67
16 |Miscellaneous materials, parts and supplies
These may amount to 10% of the total bid.
Please advise discount allowed on these unlisted items 10%
Total $4,260.28 $5,136.56
Cash Discount 2% 0%
Delivery 1 Day As Requested
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