
P09-2899 City of Florissant
Police Uniforms and Equipment

May 19, 2009

Company Company Company
IMAGE SOLUTIONS LEON ED ROEHR

Item Description UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

Uniform Trousers w/ Stripe-Male
28-42 $49.56 $43.00 $40.52
44-50 $54.81 $47.00 $40.52
52-54 $54.81 $51.00 $40.52

Uniform Trousers-Female
6-18 $49.56 $43.00 $40.52
20-24 $54.81 $47.00 $40.52

3" Belt Loop Option for all Trousers $9.97 $12.00 $8.00
Male Shirt, LS, Button Front, French Blue

14.5-17.5 $44.05 $48.00 $38.37
18-20 $50.93 $52.00 $38.37

22 N/A $56.00 $38.37
Female Shirt, LS, Button, French Blue

32-42 $44.05 $48.00 $38.37
44-46 $50.93 $52.00 $38.37

Male Shirt, LS, Zipper, French Blue
14.5-17.5 $49.56 $52.00 $42.87

18-20 $56.65 $56.00 $42.87
22 N/A $60.00 $42.87

Female Shirt, LS, Zipper, French Blue
32-42 $49.56 $52.00 $42.87
44-46 $56.65 $56.00 $42.87

Male Shirt, SS, Button, French Blue
14.5-17.5 $39.37 $44.00 $34.58

18-20 $45.67 $48.00 $34.58
22 N/A $52.00 $34.58

* Female Shirt, LS, Button, French Blue *bid on short sleeve * bid on short sleeve * bid on long sleeve
32-42 $39.37 $44.00 $38.37
44-46 $45.67 $48.00 $38.37

Male Shirt, SS, Zipper, French Blue
14.5-17.5 $45.67 $46.00 $39.08

18-20 $51.97 $50.00 $39.08
22 N/A $54.00 $39.08

Female Shirt, SS, Zipper, French Blue
32-42 $45.67 $46.00 $39.08
44-46 $51.97 $50.00 $39.08

Male Shirt, LS, Button, White
14.5-17.5 $39.90 $38.00 $30.66

18-20 $43.05 $41.00 $30.66
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Company Company Company
IMAGE SOLUTIONS LEON ED ROEHR

Item Description UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PART 122 N/A $45.00 $30.66

Male Shirt, SS, Button, White
14.5-17.5 $39.90 $36.00 $28.13

18-20 $43.05 $39.00 $28.13
22 N/A $43.00 $28.13

Male Shirt, LS, Zipper, White
14.5-17.5 $42.00 $40.00 $32.66

18-20 $46.20 $44.00 $32.66
22 N/A $48.00 $32.66

Male Shirt, SS, Zipper, White
14.5-17.5 $42.00 $38.00 $30.13

18-20 $46.20 $42.00 $30.13
22 N/A $46.00 $30.13

 Winter Jackets - Navy Blue
S-XL $229.42 $169.95 $140.00
2XL $250.42 $186.95 $140.00
3XL $271.42 $203.95 $140.00

Dress Jacket - Navy Blue
36-46 $136.50 $135.00 $120.00
48-50 $150.15 $148.00 $120.00
52-54 $163.80 $161.00 $120.00

Sleeve Braid - sewn per row $10.50 $10.00 $6.00
Raincoat with Hood: Hi-Vis rev. to Black

S-XL $93.40 $74.00 $60.94
2XL $98.65 $81.00 $60.94
3XL $111.25 $88.00 $60.94
4XL N/A $97.00 $60.94

Rain Covers for Caps-Hi-Vis rev. to Black $7.35 $9.00 $6.00
Traffic Safety Vest  - Hi-Vis Yellow-All Sizes $34.12 $44.00 $33.00

Uniform Cap $35.70 $37.90 $30.00
Metal Expansion Cap Straps No Bid $8.95 $3.00

Uniform Dickies - All Sizes $10.34 $10.95 $10.00
Dickie Embroidery - "FPD" No Bid $6.95 0.00 - INCLUDED

Uniform Clip-On Ties  
Men's Reg - 18" $4.20 $4.95 $3.20

Men's X-Long - 20" $4.72 $5.95 $3.20
Ladies Shorter - 14" $4.20 $4.95 $3.20

Polo Shirts, SS-Heather Grey/Navy/Range Red
S - 2XL $30.45 $28.95 $25.00

3XL $33.60 $34.95 $25.00
Polo Shirts, LS-Heather Grey/Navy/Range Red

S - 2XL $39.90 $38.95 $28.00

Prepared by Jenny Morris (314) 839-7621 2 of 3



P09-2899 City of Florissant
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Company Company Company
IMAGE SOLUTIONS LEON ED ROEHR

Item Description UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PART 13XL $40.95 $43.95 $28.00

Polo Embroidery
Embroidery for Com Uniy - Black $2.62 $9.95 $4.00
Embroidery for Info Tech-Black $2.62 $9.95 $4.00
Embroidery for ETU - Emblem $2.62 $14.95 $5.00
Department Shoulder Emblem No Bid $1.09 $0.99

Department Sergeant Chevrons No Bid $4.00 $2.00
Whistle, Acme Thunderer $4.20 $5.50 $3.50

Whistle,Chain $4.20 $4.95 $3.50

A. Duty Belt #7965 - Police Officers #92 Nickel $69.82 $65.00 $55.00
Duty Belt #7965 - Sergeants & above #8 Brass Finish $55.44 $7.95 $55.00

B. Cuff Case #7900 $24.25 $23.00 $19.00
C. Double Mag Pouch #7902 $33.50 $32.00 $26.00
D. Baton Ring #7904 $8.35 $9.00 $6.00
E. Exp Baton Holder - #7913 $21.26 $22.00 $16.90
F. Belt Keepers 4 pk - #7906 $12.55 $13.00 $9.90
G. Inner Belt #B57 - Black, Plain,Velcro $25.30 $26.00 $12.00
H. Uniform Holster Safariland #295 - Black BW $154.35 $145.00 / $124.95 alternate $113.63
I. Detective Holster Safariland #28 - Black Plain $48.82 $48.00 $29.44
J. DetectiveMagazine Pouch B2061 $23.57 $28.00 $19.00

First Renewal Period 6/1/09-5/31/11 3% 4% 0%
Second Renewal Period 6/1/11-5/31/12 5% 8% 0%

Discount 0% 0% 0%
Delivery Not Indicated Not Indicated

Immediate on Most 
Items
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