City of Florissant

February 9, 2009

P09-2880
Police Rifles and Accessories
Company Company Company Company Company Company Company
Lawmen's & Shooters' Proforce Law Enforcement , Personal Protection Group, , . .
Supply Proforce Law Enforcement (Alternate ltems A & B) Centilla LLC (Alternate ltem A) John's Sport Center, Inc. Rock River
ltem| Qty Description Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total

A| 8 |M&P 15 Semi-Automatic Rifle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $743.65 $5,949.20 * $1,054.00 $8,432.00 $1,165.45 $9,323.60 $1,150.00 | Not Indicated No Bid No Bid
B.| 18 |Eotech Holographic Sight $343.90 $6,190.20 $351.14 $6,320.52 $87.35 $1,572.30 $318.00 $5,724.00 $373.90 $6,730.20 $359.00 Not Indicated No Bid No Bid
C.| 18 [Blackhawk Single Point Rifle Slings $13.64 $245.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.00 $252.00 $19.70 $354.60 $39.95 Not Indicated No Bid No Bid

TOTAL $6,435.72 $6,320.52 $1,572.30 $14,408.00 $16,408.40 Not Indicated

Discount Net 10 0% 0% 0% Net 30

ltem A: Bushmaster A3M4 - Item A: Colt *incomplete/ unsigned bid
BCWA3F-16M4-Handle #COLGLAWLEG920 documents

Deleted

*Item A total price indicated for
18 units - adjusted to 8 units
after clarification

Item B: Bushmaster Low

Profile Rear Flip up sight YHM
9680

Prepared by Jenny Morris (314) 839-7621




