PW09-2878 Sign Faces and Materials February 12, 2009
Company Company Company Company Company Company Company Company
Rocal, Inc Custom Products Newman Signs, Inc American Trafflc Vulcan Signs Grimco, Inc Hall Signs, Inc Osburn Associates,
Corp. Safety Materials, Inc Inc
Item Description indicated Unit Price indicated Unit Price indicated Unit Price indicated Unit Price indicated Unit Price indicated Unit Price indicated Unit Price indicated Unit Price
Pressure Sensitive Engineer Grade
1 Stop Sign 24'x24" $4.64 $4.64 $5.18 $4.32 $4.25 $3.80
2 Stop Sign 30"x30" $7.25 $6.86 $6.92 $6.75 $6.26 $5.94
3 Yield Sign 30"x30"x30" $3.55 $4.06 $4.50 $3.44 $3.56 $2.97
4 Yield Sign 36"x36"x36 $5.11 $5.16 $5.56 $4.26 $4.95 $4.28
5 Speed Limit Sign 20 MPH 18"x24" $3.48 $3.64 $5.95 $3.24 $2.97 $2.85
6 Speed Limit Sign 25 MPH 18"x24" $3.48 $3.64 $5.95 $3.24 $2.97 $2.85
7 Speed Limit Sign 30 MPH 18"x24" $3.48 $3.64 $5.95 $3.24 $2.97 $2.85
8 Speed Limit Sign without #s 18"x24" $3.48 $3.64 R2-1 $5.95 $3.24 $2.97 $2.85
9 Do Not Enter 18"x24" $3.48 $8.64 $4.40 $3.24 $2.97 $2.85
10 Blank (white w/ black border) 24'x24" $4.64 $4.86 $5.18 $4.32 $3.82 $3.80
11 One Way Sign (Left Arrow) 36"x12" $3.48 $3.64 $4.64 $3.24 $3.14 $2.85
12 One Way Sign (Left Arrow) $3.48 $3.64 $4.64 $3.24 $3.14 $2.85
13 No Parking Anytime Sign 12"x18" $2.09 $2.05 $3.24 $1.62 $1.78 $1.43
14 No Park Anytime Sign Right Arrow 12"x18" $2.09 $2.05 $3.24 $1.62 $1.78 $1.43
15 No Parking Anytime Sign Left Arrow 12"x18" $2.09 $2.05 $3.24 $1.62 $1.78 $1.43
16 No Parking Anytime Sign Double Arrow 12"x 18" $2.09 $2.05 $3.24 $1.62 $1.78 $1.43
17 No Stopping or Standing 12"x18" $2.09 $2.05 $3.24 $1.62 $1.78 $1.43
18 No Parking Here to Corner 12" x 18" $2.09 $2.05 $3.24 $1.62 $1.78 $1.43
19 No Parking Here to Corner Right Arrow 12" x 18" $2.09 $3.05 $3.24 $1.62 $1.78 $1.43
20 No Parking Here to Corner Left Arrow 12" x 18" $2.09 $3.05 $3.24 $1.62 $1.78 $1.43
21 No Parking Between Signs 12"x18" $2.09 $2.05 $3.24 $1.62 $1.78 $1.43
22 No Parking This Side of Street 12'x18" $2.09 $2.05 $3.24 $1.62 $1.78 $1.43
23 Blank (white wired border) 12'x18" $2.09 $2.05 $3.24 $1.62 $1.78 $1.43
24 No Parking (Blank lower section) 12"x18" $2.09 $2.05 $3.24 $1.62 $1.98 $1.43
25 No Parking Anytime 12'x18" $2.09 $2.05 $3.24 $1.62 $1.78 $1.43
26| Blank - White w/green border 12'x18" $2.09 $2.05 $3.24 $1.62 $1.78 $1.43
27 No Parking Signs 12"x18" $2.09 $2.05 $3.24 $1.62 $1.78 $1.43
28 No Dumping Sign 18"x24" $3.48 $3.64 $4.40 $3.24 $2.97 $2.85
29 Blank white with black border 12'x18" $2.09 $2.05 $3.24 $1.62 $1.78 $1.43
30 Blank white w/black border 18"x24" $3.48 $3.64 $4.40 $3.24 $2.97 $2.85
31 Blank white w/black border 24"x 30" $5.80 $6.04 $5.95 $5.40 $4.71 $4.75
32 Weight Limit..... Tons Blank w/out # 18"x24" $3.48 $4.92 $5.95 $3.24 $2.97 $2.85
33 Stop for Pedestrian 24"x30" $5.80 $7.00 $4.40 $6.25 $4.71 $4.75
34 Turn left symbol 30"x30" $7.25 $7.31 $7.45 $6.75 $5.77 $5.94
35 Turn right symbol 30"x30" $7.25 $7.31 $7.45 $6.75 $5.77 $5.94
36 Curve left symbol 24'x24" $4.64 $4.86 $5.52 $4.32 $3.82 $3.80
37 Curve right symbol 24"x24" $4.64 $4.86 $5.52 $4.32 $3.82 $3.80
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PW09-2878 Sign Faces and Materials February 12, 2009
Company Company Company Company Company Company Company Company
Rocal, Inc Custom Products Newman Signs, Inc American 'I:rafﬂc Vulcan Signs Grimco, Inc Hall Signs, Inc Osburn Associates,
Corp. Safety Materials, Inc Inc
Item Description indicated Unit Price indicated Unit Price indicated Unit Price indicated Unit Price indicated Unit Price indicated Unit Price indicated Unit Price indicated Unit Price
38 Reverse curve left symbol 30"x30" $7.25 $7.31 $7.45 $6.75 $5.77 $5.94
39 Reverse curve right symbol 30"30" $7.25 $7.31 $7.45 $6.75 $5.77 $5.94
40 Large arrow symbol 48"x24" $9.28 $9.36 $8.91 $8.64 $7.67 $7.60
41 Large double headed arrow 48"x24" $9.28 $9.36 $8.91 $8.64 $7.67 $7.60
42 Stop Ahead 30"x30" $10.75 $10.35 $8.91/words - $9.91/sym $6.75 $6.79 $5.94
43 No Outlet 30"x30" $7.25 $7.31 $8.91 $6.75 $5.77 $5.94
44 Blank yellow/black border 24'x24" $4.64 $4.86 $5.52 $4.32 $3.82 $3.80
45 Blank yellow/black border 30"x30" $7.25 $7.31 $7.45 $6.75 $5.77 $5.94
46 School symbol 30"x30" $7.25 $7.31 $7.45 $6.75 $5.77 $5.94
47 School crossing symbol 30"x30" $7.25 $7.31 $7.45 $6.75 $5.77 $5.94
48 School 24"x8" $1.85 $1.82 $3.22 $1.53 $1.65 $1.27
49 Handicap symbol with parking B/W 12"x18" $2.09 $2.05 $4.73 $1.62 $1.78 $1.43
50 Street not thru black on yellow $7.25 $4.86 $5.52 $4.32 $2.72 $3.80
51 Delineator black on yellow 12"x36" $3.48 $3.64 $4.64 $3.24 $3.14 $2.85
52 Delineator black on yellow 12'x36] $3.48 $3.64 $4.64 $3.24 $3.14 $2.85
53| Stop for Pedestrian in crosswalk 24"x30" - red & white $5.80 $7.00 $5.95 $10.77 $4.71 $4.75
Truck & Busses prohibited except local delivery 24"x30"
54 black & red $5.80 $7.04 $16.82 $9.53 $13.69 $4.75
55 Road Work Ahead 30"x30" $7.25 $9.71 $9.17 $6.75 $5.77 $5.94
56 Fresh Qil 30"x30" $7.25 $9.71 $9.17 $6.75 $5.77 $5.94
57| Men working ahead 30"x30" $7.25 $9.71 $9.17 $6.75 $5.77 $5.94
58, Road Closed Ahead 30"x30" $7.25 $9.71 $9.17 $6.75 $5.77 $5.94
59 Single Lane Ahead 30"x30" $7.25 $9.71 $21.77 $6.75 $5.77 $5.94
60| One Lane Road Ahead 30"x30" $7.25 $9.71 $9.17 $6.75 $5.77 $5.94
61 Detour left arrow 30"x24" $5.80 $7.96 $7.75 $5.40 $4.71 $4.75
62 Detour right arrow 30"x24" $5.80 $7.96 $7.75 $5.40 $4.71 $4.75
63 Advance School Crosswalk 30"x30" $7.25 $7.31 $7.75 $6.75 $5.77 $5.94
64 Advance School Crosswalk 30"x30" $7.25 $7.31 $7.75 $6.75 $5.77 $5.94
Reflective Sheeting Pressure Sensitive-
Engineering Grade
65 Green Reflective Sheeting 6"x 50yds $61.50 $64.96 3277 $63.75 6015-P154 $61.50 3277 $69.00 3277 $57.65 $91.25 3277 $56.25
66| Green Reflective sheeting 24'x50yds. $246.00 $261.31 3217 $255.00 NV62450-P154 $246.00 3217 $276.00 $237.00 $273.75 3217 $225.00
Pressure Sensitive Engineer Grade
67 White reflective sheeting 6"x50yds. $61.50 $64.96 3290 $63.75 6015-P152 $61.50 3290 $69.00 3290 $57.65 $91.25 3290 $56.25
68 White reflective sheeting 24"50yds. $246.00 $261.31 3290 $255.00 NV62450-P152 $246.00 3290 $276.00 $237.00 $273.75 3290 $225.00
69 Parkway white reflective 6'x50yds. $61.50 NO BID 3290 $63.75 NO BID $91.25 3290 $56.25
70 Parkway white reflective sheeting 24"x50yds. $246.00 NO BID 3290 $255.00 NO BID $273.75 3290 $225.00
71 Brown reflective sheeting 24"x50yds| $246.00 $261.31 3279 $255.00 NV62450-P157 $246.00 3279 $276.00 3279 $237.00 $273.75 3279 $225.00
72 Black reflective sheeting 6"x50yds. $61.50 NO BID 180-12P $106.50 6015-P158 $67.13 772512 $77.10 $57.65 $95.00 772512 $66.56
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PW09-2878

Sign Faces and Materials

February 12, 2009

Company Company Company Company Company Company Company Company
Rocal, Inc Custom Products Newman Signs, Inc American 'I:rafﬂc Vulcan Signs Grimco, Inc Hall Signs, Inc Osburn Associates,
Corp. Safety Materials, Inc Inc
Item Description indicated Unit Price indicated Unit Price indicated Unit Price indicated Unit Price indicated Unit Price indicated Unit Price indicated Unit Price indicated Unit Price
Reflective Sheeting Pressure Sensitive-
Engineering Grade
73 Green reflective sheeting 6"x50yds| $61.50 $64.96 $63.75 6015-P154 $61.50 $69.00 $57.65 $91.25 $56.25
74 Green reflective sheeting 24'x50yds. $246.00 $261.31 $255.00 NV62450-P154 $246.00 $276.00 $237.00 $273.75 $225.00
75 White reflective sheeting 6"x50yds. $61.50 $64.96 $63.75 6015-P152 $61.50 $69.00 $57.65 $91.25 $56.25
76) White reflective sheeting 24'x50yds. $246.00 $261.31 $255.00 NV62450-P152 $246.00 $276.00 $237.00 $273.75 $225.00
77 Parkway white reflective sheeting 6"x50 yds. $61.50 NO BID $63.75 NO BID $91.25 $56.25
78 Parkway white reflective sheeting 24"x50yds. $246.00 NO BID $255.00 NO BID $273.75 $225.00
Pressure Sensitive Engineer Grade
79 Brown reflective sheeting 24"x50yds| $246.00 $261.31 $255.00 NV62450-P157 $246.00 $276.00 $237.00 $273.75 $225.00
80 Black reflective sheeting 6"x50yds. $61.50 NO BID 180-12P $106.50 6015-P158 $67.13 7725-12 $77.10 $57.65 $95.00 7725-12 $66.56
Pressure Sensitive High Intensity Grade
81 Green reflective sheeting 6'x50yds. $105.00 $123.55 3937 $131.25 6015-3877 $123.75 3937 $131.25 3937 $117.75 $156.00 3937 $111.75
82 Red reflective sheeting 6'x50yds. $105.00 $123.55 3932 $131.25 6015-3872 $123.75 3932 $131.25 3932 $117.75 $156.00 3932 $111.75
83 Yellow reflective sheeting 6'x50yds. $105.00 $123.55 3931 $131.25 6015-3871 $123.75 3231 $131.25 3931 $117.75 $156.00 3931 $111.75
84 Blue reflective sheeting 6"x50yds. $105.00 $123.55 3935 $131.25 6015-3875 $123.75 3235 $131.25 3935 $117.75 $156.00 3935 $111.75
85 Brown reflective sheeting 6'x50yds. $105.00 $123.55 3939 $131.25 6015-3879 $123.75 3239 $131.25 3939 $117.75 $156.00 3939 $111.75
Reflective Sheeting High Intensity Grade
86 Stop Sign 24"x24" $6.60 $8.60 $9.07 $8.08 $7.94 $6.96
87| Stop for Pedistrian in Crosswalk 24'x30" $8.25 $11.78 $7.32 $10.75 $9.32 $8.70
Cut Out Letters
88 Letters 6" Series "B" - 25/ pkg $16.91 $10.58 3290 $7.91 3290 $9.50 $7.25 $6.81 $5.67
89 Letters 4" Series "B" - 25/ pkg $11.97 $3.12 3290 $5.40 3290 $6.50 3290 $3.95 $4.24 $3.52
90 Letters 2" Series "B" - 25/ pkg $9.72 $1.53 3290 $4.56 3290 $5.50 $2.25 $2.96 $2.47
Cut Out Letters Pressure Sensitive
91 Letters 6" Series "B" - 25/ pkg $16.91 $10.58 3290 $7.91 3290 $9.50 3290 $7.25 $6.81 $5.67
92 Letters 4" Series "B" - 25/ pkg $11.97 $3.12 3290 $5.40 3290 $6.50 $3.95 $4.24 $3.52
93 Letters 2" Series "B" - 25/ pkg $9.72 $1.53 3290 $4.56 3290 $5.50 $2.25 $2.96 $2.47
Pressure Sensitive Engineer Grade
94 Red 2" Series "C" - 25/ pkg $9.72 $2.67 3290 $4.40 3272 $5.50 $2.55 $3.08 $2.57
95 Green 2" letters Series "C" - 25/ pkg $9.72 $2.67 3290 $4.40 3277 $5.50 $2.55 $3.08 $2.57
96 Black 2" letters Series "C" - 25/ pkg $9.72 $1.78 $4.87 $4.50 $2.35 $2.60 $2.17
97, Black 3" letters Series "C" - 25/ pkg $10.59 $2.63 $5.33 $5.50 $3.25 $3.40 $2.83
98] Black 4" letters series "C" - 25/ pkg $11.97 $3.54 $7.04 $6.50 $4.10 $4.12 $3.43
DELIVERY 30 DAYS 30 21-30 DAYS 14TH DAY 30 DAYS ARO 7-10 DAYS ARO 30-45 DAYS ARO 30 DAYS ARO
DISCOUNT 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 2% - 10 DAYS

Prepared by: Jenny Morris

Minimum Order $1,000

Prices good thru Dec. 31, 2009
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