
PW09-2869 CONSTRUCTION MAINTENANCE MATERIALS NOVEMBER 14, 2008

Qty Description Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered

1 2400 CY
Portland Cement Concrete 
w/Limestone Stone

a 6 1/2 Sack with Meramec Sand No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.50 $78.50 $73.50 $73.50 $75.00 $75.00 $83.50 $83.50
b 6 1/2 Sack with River Sand No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.10 $74.10 $71.00 $71.00 $72.50 $72.50 $81.00 $81.00
c 6 1/2 Sack with All Purpose Sand No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.45 $77.45 $73.50 $73.50 $75.00 $75.00 $83.50 $83.50

2 2400 CY
Portland Cement Concrete 
w/Meramec Gravel

a 6 1/2 Sack with Meramec Sand No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.00 $80.00 $73.50 $73.50 $75.00 $75.00 $83.50 $83.50
b 6 1/2 Sack with River Sand No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.60 $75.60 $71.00 $71.00 $72.50 $72.50 $81.00 $81.00
c 6 1/2 Sack with All Purpose Sand No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.95 $78.95 $73.50 $73.50 $75.00 $75.00 $83.50 $83.50

3 Asphaltic Concrete
a 1300 T Type C No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.50 $52.15 No Bid No Bid $49.00 $54.00 No Bid No Bid $50.00 $55.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
b 100 T Type X No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.50 $52.15 No Bid No Bid $49.00 $54.00 No Bid No Bid $50.00 $55.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
c 100 T Type D No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.50 $52.15 No Bid No Bid $49.00 $54.00 No Bid No Bid $50.00 $55.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
d 100 T Type E (curb mix) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $62.00 $66.65 No Bid No Bid $59.00 $64.00 No Bid No Bid $72.25 $77.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
e 100 T Cold Mix UPM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $115.00 $124.00 $105.00 $110.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 Crushed Stone
a 4000 T Type 1 -1 inch Minus $4.90 $10.90 $5.10 $8.30 $5.25 $10.15 $4.80 $11.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.30 $8.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
b 100 T Type 1 -1 1/2 inch Minus $4.90 $10.90 $5.00 $8.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.30 $8.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
c 400 T Type 1 - 2 inch Minus $4.90 $10.90 $5.00 $8.20 $4.50 $9.40 $4.80 $11.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.30 $8.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
d 100 T Rip Rap (1 man) $10.00 $17.00 $11.50 $15.70 $9.00 $13.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
e 500 T Screening $1.00 $7.00 $3.25 $6.45 $2.50 $7.40 $2.25 $8.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.40 $7.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
f 300 T 1 inch Clean $8.20 $14.20 $8.60 $11.80 $8.50 $13.40 $8.15 $14.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.75 $13.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
g 300 T 1/2" Clean $8.20 $14.20 $9.00 $12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
h 300 T 1/2" Minus $4.90 $10.90 $6.00 $9.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sand:
i-1 100 T River $4.90 $10.90 $6.00 $9.20 $7.00 $12.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
i-2 100 T Meramec No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.75 $18.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
j 100 T Top Dressing Sand No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.50 $24.75 $12.75 $18.50 $7.95 $13.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
k 100 T Pea Gravel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.50 $24.75 $8.50 $14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 Liquid Asphalt
a 2000 10-gal MC-30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $410.00 $4.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
b 2000 10-gal 85-100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.99 $4.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
c 2000 10-gal 70-85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.99 $4.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
d 2000 10-gal AC-20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.99 $4.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Discount

Quality Sand

0% 0%

COMPANY

Fred Weber

0%

COMPANY

Missouri Petroleum

0%

COMPANY

Eastern Mo. Concrete
COMPANY COMPANYCOMPANY COMPANY COMPANY COMPANYCOMPANYCOMPANY COMPANY

Bussen Quarries Central Stone

0% 0%

Pace ConstructionSimpson Const.

0%

LaFarge

0% 0%

Breckenridge

0%

Metro Materials

1% - 10 Days

Kienstra

0%
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