
GC09-2866 City of Florissant
Various Equipment Parts

November 10, 2008

QTY DESCRIPTION COMPANY COMPANY COMPANY
Art's TPEC R & R
Unit Unit Unit

Scag ZTR
1 3 Oil Filter $6.99 No Bid No Bid
2 1 Hydraulic Filter No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 1 Canopy No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 1 Canopy Bracket No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 2 Gas Dumper No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ransome 250 Fairway Unit

1 1 Filter No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 1 Step No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 1 Fuel Sender No Bid No Bid No Bid

Kubota L4200 Tractor
1 2 Filter $40.24 No Bid $42.25
2 1 Muffler $283.76 No Bid No Bid
3 2 Filter, 17321-3243-0 $9.95 No Bid $5.00
4 1 Gasket $4.06 No Bid $3.70
5 1 Filter, 15521-4316-0 $4.67 No Bid $4.00
6 1 Tie Rod End $29.81 No Bid $31.30

Toro 3100 Sidewinder
1 2 Oil Filter No Bid $10.38 $4.95
2 3 Pivot Shaft No Bid $23.82 $20.45
3 1 Fuel Pump No Bid $149.28 No Bid
4 1 Damper Assembly No Bid $79.03 No Bid
5 6 Bedbar Pivot No Bid $11.54 $9.75
6 12 Rubber Bushing No Bid $3.03 $2.60
7 6 Bearing, 88-7880 No Bid $14.85 $13.10
8 6 Bearing, 100-4926 No Bid $15.99 $14.05

Toro 3150 Tee Mower
1 6 Bedknives No Bid $28.86 $24.75
2 12 Flange Bushing No Bid $0.56 $0.48
3 10 Bumper No Bid $1.75 $1.50
4 6 Bushing No Bid $2.05 $1.85
5 9 Roller No Bid $113.41 $95.40
6 4 Oil Filter $10.98 $9.25 $9.55
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Toro 3150 Greensmower
1 4 Air Filter $13.80 $10.60 $4.85
2 2 Oil Filter $10.98 $9.25 $9.55
3 6 Bedknives No Bid $28.02 $24.05
4 1 Backlap Kit No Bid $713.12 No Bid
5 1 Regulator $75.55 $79.98 $72.80
6 1 Brake Shoe No Bid $16.99 $15.30

Reelmaster 6700 Fairway Unit
1 1 Fan Clutch No Bid $155.91 No Bid
2 1 Air Filter 93-9162 No Bid $58.75 $14.40
3 1 Air Filter 93-9163 No Bid $41.79 $14.65
4 1 Lift Arm No Bid $390.93 No Bid
5 1 Cylinder 99-6986 No Bid $290.57 No Bid
6 1 Cylinder 93-2631 No Bid $300.74 No Bid
7 2 Seal Kit No Bid $56.77 No Bid
8 20 Seal R253-152 No Bid $2.50 $2.15
9 20 Bearing Cup No Bid $2.25 $2.00
10 2 Oil Filter No Bid $15.90 $4.50
11 20 Bearing Cone No Bid $4.29 $3.75
12 20 Seal R253-117 No Bid $3.39 $2.25
13 12 Bedknives No Bid $49.13 $29.55

Toro 4000D Roughmower
1 1 Air Cleaner Assembly No Bid $173.53 No Bid
2 1 Fan Clutch No Bid $378.36 No Bid
3 4 Spacer No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 6 Bearing No Bid $7.99 $7.05
5 2 Seal Kit No Bid $60.34 No Bid
6 2 Hub No Bid $33.27 $28.55
7 3 Air Filter, 104-4260 No Bid $23.96 No Bid
8 1 Air Filter, 104-4261 No Bid $21.45 No Bid
9 4 Roller No Bid $6.82 $5.45
10 1 Oil Filter No Bid $38.49 $34.00
11 4 Idler Pully No Bid $23.05 $19.80
12 2 Belt No Bid $11.89 No Bid
13 2 Muffler Gasket No Bid $5.22 No Bid
14 1 Gasket No Bid $3.53 No Bid
15 1 Oil Seal No Bid $3.53 No Bid
16 3 Wheel No Bid $115.99 $85.30
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17 1 Muffler No Bid $332.63 No Bid
18 3 Filter No Bid $16.19 $5.00
19 4 Bushing No Bid $7.33 No Bid
20 2 Seal Kit No Bid $58.64 No Bid
21 1 Seat Suspension No Bid $584.95 No Bid
22 4 Bushing, 104-8340 No Bid $7.78 $20.00
23 4 Bushing, 104-3517 No Bid $4.53 No Bid
24 4 Bushing, 256-132 No Bid $2.98 No Bid
25 4 Seal Kit No Bid $8.54 No Bid
26 1 Coil No Bid $85.56 No Bid
27 2 Cross & Bearing Kit No Bid $182.66 No Bid
28 1 Screen Assembly No Bid $681.07 No Bid

Toro Multi Pro 5500 Sprayer
1 1 Pressure Gauge No Bid $56.07 No Bid
2 1 Sun Shade No Bid $691.65 No Bid

Toro Sand Pro
1 2 Air Cleaner No Bid $12.92 No Bid

Tycrop Pro Pass Top Dresser 180
1 1 Conveyor Belt No Bid $493.32 No Bid

Goodsen Blower
1 8 Belt No Bid $56.69 No Bid

Discount 0% 0% 0%
Delivery 15 Days ARO 2-5 Days ARO
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