
GC09-2865 City of Florissant
Various Golf Course Accessories

November 4, 2008

QTY DESCRIPTION COMPANY COMPANY COMPANY COMPANY COMPANY
Easy Picker 
Golf Products

John Deere 
Landscapes

Supreme Turf 
Products

Miltona Turf 
Products TPEC

Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
Par-Aide

1 3 Ballwasher Repair Kit $56.00 $69.98 $58.00 no bid $60.29
2 14 No Carts Beyond Kits no bid no bid $15.75 no bid $15.28
3 20 18" Sign Posts no bid no bid $15.75 no bid $15.28
4 4 30 Gallon Tapered Liter Caddle $124.80 no bid $92.00 no bid $90.00
5 2 (Cases) Sparkleen $12.00 no bid $46.50 no bid $45.35
6 80 Accuform Ace II Bunker Rake $22.80 $20.00 $18.30 no bid $19.00

Standard Golf
1 18 Double Sided Flags w/ Logo $28.00 no bid $224.00 no bid $225.00
2 18 Double Sided Flags w/ Logo $28.00 no bid $224.00 no bid $225.00
3 18 Double Sided Flags w/ Logo $28.00 no bid $224.00 no bid $225.00
4 2 (Cases) Chix Tee Towels $76.00 no bid $85.00 no bid $103.77

Miltona
1 2 HIO Cup Cutter $536.00 no bid $500.00 $563.39 no bid
2 6 Yellow Poly Rope $34.80 no bid $28.00 $45.04 no bid
3 2 Cup Cutter Depth Ring no bid no bid $15.00 $40.87 no bid

Bayco Golf Inc.
1 1 12ft Yellow Tournament Flag Poles $50.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid

Kirby Markers
1 13 Red, White Numbers (100 yds) $62.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid
2 15 Green, Yellow Numbers (125 yds) $62.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid
3 17 White, Black Numbers (150 yds) $62.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid
4 11 Yellow Black Numbers (175 yds) $62.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid
5 10 Blue, White Numbers (200 yds) $62.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid
6 6 Black, White Numbers (225 yds) $62.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid
7 5 Green, Yellow Numbers (250 yds) $62.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid
8 2 Yellow, Black Numbers (174 yds) $62.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid
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9 2 White, Black Numbers (165 yds) $62.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid
10 1 White, Black Numbers (160 yds) $62.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid
11 1 Green, Yellow Numbers (135 yds) $62.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid
12 1 Green, Yellow Numbers (135 yds) $62.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid
13 1 Green, Yellow Numbers (123 yds) $62.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid
14 1 Red, White Numbers (115 yds) $62.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid
15 1 Red, White Numbers (110 yds) $62.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid
16 1 Red, White Numbers (90 yds) $62.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid
17 1 Red, White Numbers (80 yds) $62.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid
18 1 Green, Yellow Numbersn (124 yds) $62.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid

Discount 0% $0.00 0% 0% 0%
Delivery 3 weeks ARO 7-10 Days ARO 10 Days ARO
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