
GC09-2864 Grass Seed, Chemicals and Fertilizers October 29, 2008

COMPANY COMPANY COMPANY COMPANY COMPANY COMPANY COMPANY COMPANY COMPANY
Pennington 

Seed
Agri-Service 
Consultants Helena Turfgrass, Inc. John Deere 

Landscapes Supreme Turf Agro-Logics Univar Veatch 
Chemical

Item Unit Description Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

Grass Seed

1 per lb Turf type Fescue 3 $1.20 No Bid $1.10 $1.24 $1.09 $1.08 $1.00 No Bid $1.19

2 per lb Penncross Creeping Bentgrass $7.40 No Bid $7.90 $12.00 $6.75 $8.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 per lb A-4 Creeping Bentgrass No Bid No Bid $10.10 $9.10 $10.90 $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fertilizer (Liquid/Dry)

1 gal Astron No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $89.16 No Bid No Bid

2 gal Calphlex No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $41.65 No Bid No Bid

3 gal Maxiplex No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.61 No Bid No Bid

4 gal Phlex Man No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $37.61 No Bid No Bid

5 gal Perk Up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $87.74 No Bid No Bid

6 gal Renaissance No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.78 No Bid No Bid

7 gal Knife No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.00 No Bid No Bid

8 gal FG 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Discontinued No Bid No Bid

9 gal P48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.27 No Bid No Bid

10 50lb bag Nature Safe Fertilizer No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.00 $22.71 $34.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

11 50lb bag White Gold 0-0-25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.00 No Bid No Bid $37.00 No Bid No Bid

12 50lb bag White Gold Complete No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.00 No Bid No Bid

13 50lb bag Grigg Bros. 7-7-7 No Bid No Bid No Bid $37.00 No Bid $42.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

14 50lb bag Dry Organic Crumble No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.00 No Bid No Bid

15 50lb bag Mesa No Bid No Bid $29.95 $34.00 No Bid $34.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

16 gal Quelant K No Bid $335.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

17 gal Quelant Ca No Bid $330.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

18 gal Macro Sorb Foliar No Bid $370.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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19 gal Macro Sorb Radicular No Bid $245.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

20 gal Nutramax Minors No Bid $350.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

21 gal Megalex No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

22 gal Carbon N No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.29 No Bid No Bid

23 gal P-K Fight No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $67.20 No Bid No Bid

24 gal Protosyn No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.55 No Bid No Bid

25 lb or gal Sprayable Ammonium Sulfate No Bid No Bid $0.24 No Bid No Bid $26.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

26 lb  Sulfur or Potash Greens No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.92 $33.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

27 lb Soy Flo No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

28 lb Genisis Calcium No Bid $300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

29 oz Soil Restore No Bid $123.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

30 oz Soil Bacteria No Bid $42.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

31 gal Ultraplex No Bid No Bid No Bid $51.00 No Bid $50.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

32 gal P-K Plus No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.40 No Bid $59.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

33 bag 0-0-7 with .43% Barricade No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.00 $14.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

34 bag 8-3-23 with .43% Barricade No Bid No Bid $27.59 $32.00 $29.21 $35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

35 gal Establish - Analysis 5-16-12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

36 gal Huma - Balance No Bid $25.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

37 gal Root & Groom - Analysis 3-16-15 No Bid $64.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

38 gal Huma - Cal Plus No Bid $35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

39 50lb bag Excellerator-Granule-39% Silicon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Growth Regulators

1 gal Primo Maxx No Bid No Bid $419.00 $407.00 $411.47 $322.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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2 gal Proxy No Bid No Bid $37.40 $39.00 $46.84 $40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 gal Trimit No Bid No Bid $385.00 $407.00 No Bid $406.00 $235.00 No Bid No Bid

4 gal Embark-Growth Retardant No Bid No Bid $45.00 $304.00 $301.81 $50.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 gal Cutless No Bid No Bid $298.50 $1,400.00 $742.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fungicides

1 gal Banner Max No Bid No Bid $332.94 $316.00 $366.43 $288.00 $174.50 No Bid $124.00

2 lb Signature No Bid No Bid $22.87 $485.00 $22.12 $22.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 gal 26GT No Bid No Bid $124.00 $124.00 $64.72 $123.00 $67.50 No Bid No Bid

4 gal 3336-F No Bid No Bid $133.00 $141.00 $92.06 $126.00 $104.62 No Bid No Bid

5 gal 3336 plus No Bid No Bid $92.00 $92.00 No Bid $92.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 cs Daconil Ultrex No Bid No Bid $189.60 $189.60 $47.40 $189.60 $140.00 No Bid $141.00

7 cs Prostar 70 WP No Bid No Bid $490.00 $465.00 $586.97 $598.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 gal Banol No Bid No Bid $368.00 $383.00 $440.23 $382.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 cs Bayleton No Bid No Bid $440.00 $460.00 $532.07 $1,490.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 cs Endorse No Bid No Bid $669.00 $669.00 $772.85 $669.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

11 gal Alude No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $68.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

12 lb Hertiage No Bid No Bid $394.00 $394.00 $394.00 $394.00 $1,100.00 No Bid No Bid

13 cs Compass No Bid No Bid $1,380.00 $1,398.00 $1,769.56 $1,560.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

14 cs Eagle No Bid No Bid $1,040.00 $240.00 $362.23 $200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

15 gal Sprotrete F No Bid No Bid $35.00 $43.00 $39.18 $38.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

16 gal Tartan No Bid No Bid $428.80 $428.80 $520.00 $428.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid

17 gal Instrata No Bid No Bid $147.90 $147.90 $369.75 $147.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid

18 gal Headway No Bid No Bid $535.00 $516.00 $652.92 $540.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Herbicides
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1 cs Barricade 65 WG No Bid No Bid $1,612.76 $1,500.00 $949.40 $1,942.50 $510.00 No Bid $750.00

2 bottle Manage No Bid No Bid $80.00 $99.00 $103.60 $88.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 gal Round Up Pro No Bid No Bid $44.29 $55.00 $45.60 $44.75 No Bid No Bid $120.00

4 gal Speedzone No Bid No Bid $53.00 $61.00 $56.97 $56.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 gal Bensumic No Bid No Bid $79.00 $95.00 $94.01 $80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 gal Surge No Bid No Bid $39.00 $45.00 $61.42 $41.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 gal Confront No Bid No Bid $117.84 $136.00 $129.76 $112.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 bag Ronstar No Bid No Bid $73.50 $89.00 $95.27 $80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 gal Drive No Bid No Bid $77.78 $88.00 $66.63 $84.00 $58.75 No Bid No Bid

10 box Remay Root Barrier (Treflon Cap) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11 gal Acclaim No Bid No Bid $450.00 $591.00 $629.47 $520.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

12 cs Tordon RTU No Bid No Bid $112.00 No Bid No Bid $192.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Insecticides/Misc.

1 cs Dylox 80 No Bid No Bid $242.28 $254.00 No Bid $265.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 cs Merit 75 W5P No Bid No Bid $305.85 $303.00 $437.83 $314.00 $168.75 No Bid $384.00

3 cs Tank Cleaner No Bid No Bid $59.05 $142.00 $60.00 $64.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 gal Mach 2 No Bid No Bid $104.00 No Bid $112.73 $99.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 cs Sevin Insectiscide No Bid No Bid $175.00 $163.00 $40.40 $138.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 cs Talprid Mole Bait No Bid No Bid $160.00 $50.00 $199.88 $55.00 No Bid $168.75 No Bid

Discount 0% 5% - 10 Days 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%

Prices good through 
2008

See Bid Documents for Additional Specifications.
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